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Bridges Eligibility Manual (BEM) 400 (2016) defines assets as cash, any other personal 
property and real property. Real property is land and objects affixed to the land such as 
buildings, trees and fences. Condominiums are real property. Personal property is any 
item subject to ownership that is not real property. It instructs Department workers that, 
to determine the fair market value of real property the following is to be used: 

 Deed, mortgage, purchase agreement or contract.  

 State Equalized Value (SEV) on current property tax records multiplied by two.  

 Statement of real estate agent or financial institution.  

 Attorney or court records.  

 County records.  
 
As such, this Administrative Law Judge concludes that when determining the value of 
the property it would seem in accordance with departmental policy to use the SEV of the 
property times two. The Department’s workers at the hearing were perhaps correct 
when they speculated that the worker who took action likely had questions based on the 
verification submitted by the Petitioner. Regardless, that worker did telephone the 
County tax office and obtained the SEV, and did multiply it by two, to arrive at the figure 
used in the divestment. 
 
Bridges Administrative Manual (BAM) 130 (2016) p. 8, provides that the Department’s 
worker, before determining eligibility, give the client a reasonable opportunity to resolve 
any discrepancy between her statements and information from another source. In this 
case, the Department’s worker should have given the Petitioner an opportunity to 
resolve the discrepancy between the verification submitted to the figure provided by the 
county tax office. This is particularly true, as the Petitioner’s AHR argues that the real 
estate is part of a cooperative and that this can be valued somewhat differently. 
 

DECISION AND ORDER 
 
Accordingly, the Department’s determination is AFFIRMED/ REVERSED. 
 
THE DEPARTMENT IS ORDERED TO INITIATE THE FOLLOWING, IN 
ACCORDANCE WITH DEPARTMENT POLICY AND CONSISTENT WITH THIS 
HEARING DECISION, INCLUDING ISSUING A NEW ELIGIBILITY DECISION, WITHIN 
10 DAYS OF THE DATE THE ORDER WAS ISSUED: 
 
1. Redetermine the Petitioner’s eligibility for Long Term Care back to November 16, 

2015, and 

2. Give the Petitioner an opportunity to resolve any discrepancies between her 
statement and submitted verifications and information from another source before 
determining eligibility, and 








