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the program pursuant to MCL 400.10 and provides services to adults and children 
pursuant to MCL 400.14(1) and Mich Admin Code, R 400.5001-.5020.  
 
In Barry v Corrigan, No. 13-cv-13185, 2015 WL 136238 (ED Mich Jan 9, 2015), the 
Court concluded that notices the Department sent clients and applicants from 
December 30, 2012 to January 9, 2015 denying, terminating, or reducing FIP, 
SDA,RAP, or CDC benefits due to fugitive felon disqualification violated procedural due 
process under the Fourteenth Amendment to the U.S. Constitution. The Court’s March 
31, 2015 Order Regarding…Implementation of the Court’s January 9, 2015 Order set 
forth a process for which applicants or beneficiaries of FIP, SDA, RAP, or CDC benefits 
from December 30, 2012 to January 9, 2015 could seek restoration of the benefits 
through an administrative hearing process if those benefits were affected due to fugitive 
felon disqualification.  Petitioner sought restoration of benefits through this 
administrative hearing process.  This Administrative Law Judge is obligated to 
determine whether Petitioner’s benefits were affected due to fugitive felon 
disqualification pursuant to the Court’s March 31, 2015 Order 
Regarding…Implementation of the Court’s January 9, 2015 Order. 
 
At hearing, the Department testified and/or provided documentary evidence that it did 
deny, terminate, or reduce CDC benefits due to fugitive felon disqualification during the 
relevant time period.  
 
Additionally, Petitioner’s hearing request was also marked to appeal a fugitive felon 
criminal justice disqualification for cash assistance.  The Eligibility Specialist credibly 
testified Petitioner’s case record did not show a negative case action regarding cash 
assistance during the relevant time period. Petitioner testified he had been triaged three 
times and, therefore, he could not receive cash benefits.  Accordingly, Petitioner was 
aware that his ineligibility for cash assistance was not based on a fugitive felon criminal 
justice disqualification. 
 
As confirmed with the Eligibility Specialist during the hearing proceedings, the 
Department is addressing the fugitive felon disqualification issues related to the Food 
Assistance Program (FAP) separately.  This ALJ has no jurisdiction to address FAP as 
part of this administrative hearing. 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
  
 






