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The Food Assistance Program (FAP) [formerly known as the Food Stamp program] is 
established by the Food and Nutrition Act of 2008, as amended, 7 USC 2011 to 2036a 
and is implemented by the federal regulations contained in 7 CFR 273.  The 
Department (formerly known as the Department of Human Services) administers FAP 
pursuant to MCL 400.10, the Social Welfare Act, MCL 400.1-.119b, and Mich Admin 
Code, R 400.3001-.3011. 

Assets means cash, any other personal property and real property. Real property is 
land and objects affixed to the land such as buildings, trees and fences. Personal 
property is any item subject to ownership that is not real property.  Countable assets 
cannot exceed the applicable asset limit.  An asset is countable if it meets the 
availability tests and is not excluded.  Available means that someone in the asset group 
has the legal right to use or dispose of the asset.  Department of Human Services 
Bridges Eligibility Manual (BEM) 400 (October 1, 2014), pp 1-7. 

On January 23, 2015, the Department received the Claimant’s application for FAP 
benefits.  Based on the information reported by the Claimant on her application for 
assistance, the Department determined that the Claimant’s countable cash assets 
exceeded the limit to receive FAP benefits in accordance with BEM 400.  On February 
25, 2014, the Department sent the Claimant notice that it had denied her FAP 
application. 

The Claimant conceded that she reported cash assets exceeding $  on her 
application for assistance, but that these assets have been depleted since her 
application was denied. 

The Administrative Law Judge, based on the above Findings of Fact and Conclusions of 
Law, and for the reasons stated on the record, if any, finds that the Department acted in 
accordance with Department policy when it denied the Claimant’s application for Food 
Assistance Program (FAP), based on her countable assets at that time. 

DECISION AND ORDER 

Accordingly, the Department’s decision is AFFIRMED.  
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