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CONCLUSIONS OF LAW 

 
The State Emergency Relief (SER) program is established by the Social Welfare Act, 
MCL 400.1-.119b. The SER program is administered by DHHS (formerly known as the 
Family Independence Agency) pursuant to MCL 400.10 and Mich Admin Code, R 
400.7001 through R 400.7049. DHHS policies are contained in the Department of 
Human Services Emergency Relief Manual (ERM).  
 
Claimant requested a hearing to dispute an SER decision. Specifically, Claimant sought 
$819 for the purchase and installation of a water heater (see Exhibit 4). DHHS approved 
Claimant for $511 of the total requested cost, but required Claimant to first pay $308 by 
April 21, 2015. Claimant specifically objected to her obligation to make a copayment. 
 
A group is eligible for non-energy SER services with respect to income if the total 
combined monthly net income that is received or expected to be received by all group 
members in the 30-day countable income period does not exceed the standards found 
in Exhibit I, SER Income Need Standards for Non-Energy Services. ERM 208 (October 
2014), p. 1. The income-need standard for a group size of 1 is $445. Id., p. 5. 
 
It was not disputed that Claimant was a group size of 1 with a monthly income of 
$753/month. Subtracting Claimant’s income need standard ($445) from her monthly 
income results in an income copayment of $308, exactly the amount that DHHS 
calculated as a copayment. 
 
Claimant contended that DHHS should have factored her monthly mortgage and utility 
obligations. SER budget procedures do not factor mortgage or utilities.  
 
If the SER group meets all eligibility criteria but has a copayment, shortfall or 
contribution, DHHS is to not issue payment until the client provides proof that their 
payment has been made or will be made by another agency. Id., p. 4. Verification of 
payment must be received in the local office within the 30-day eligibility period or no 
SER payment will be made. Id. The client will then have to reapply. Id. 
 
DHHS gave client 30 days from the date of Claimant’s application to make her 
copayment. Clamant testified that she requested an extension on the 30 day period. As 
implied above, extensions on copayments are not permitted; Claimant’s remedy is to 
reapply. 
 
It should be noted that DHHS has discretion to modify income copayments (see ERM 
208, pp. 7-8). A consideration of income copayment modification may not be 
undertaken because income copayment modification is not an entitlement.  
 
Based on the presented evidence, it is found that DHHS properly determined Claimant 
to be eligible for $511 of SER, subject to a $308 Claimant copayment. Claimant’s failure 
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to make her copayment by  justified non-payment of the conditional SER 
approval. 
 

DECISION AND ORDER 
 

The Administrative Law Judge, based upon the above findings of fact and conclusions 
of law, finds that DHHS properly denied Claimant’s SER request for home repairs. The 
actions taken by DHHS are AFFIRMED. 
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NOTICE OF APPEAL:  A party may appeal this Hearing Decision in the circuit court in 
the county in which he/she resides, or the circuit court in Ingham County, within 30 days 
of the receipt date.  A copy of the claim or application for appeal must be filed with the 
Michigan Administrative Hearing System (MAHS).   
 
A party may request a rehearing or reconsideration of this Hearing Decision from MAHS 
within 30 days of the mailing date of this Hearing Decision, or MAHS MAY order a 
rehearing or reconsideration on its own motion.  MAHS MAY grant a party’s Request for 
Rehearing or Reconsideration when one of the following exists: 
 

 Newly discovered evidence that existed at the time of the original hearing that 
could affect the outcome of the original hearing decision; 

 Misapplication of manual policy or law in the hearing decision which led to a 
wrong conclusion; 

 Typographical, mathematical or other obvious error in the hearing decision that 
affects the rights of the client; 

 Failure of the ALJ to address in the hearing decision relevant issues raised in the 
hearing request. 

 
The party requesting a rehearing or reconsideration must specify all reasons for the 
request.  MAHS will not review any response to a request for rehearing/reconsideration.  






