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____ 
The Medical Assistance (MA) program is established by the Title XIX of the Social 
Security Act, 42 USC 1396-1396w-5, and is implemented by 42 CFR 400.200 to 
1008.59.  The Department of Human Services (formerly known as the Family 
Independence Agency) administers the MA program pursuant to MCL 400.10 and MCL 
400.105.   
 
The State Disability Assistance (SDA) program is established by the Social Welfare Act, 
MCL 400.1-.119b.  The Department of Human Services (formerly known as the Family 
Independence Agency) administers the SDA program pursuant to MCL 400.10 and 
Mich Admin Code, R 400.3151-.3180.   
 
Michigan adopts the mailbox rule which is a presumption under the common-law that 
letters have been received after being placed in the mail in the due course of business. 
Good v Detroit Automobile Inter-Insurance Exchange, 67 Mich App 270 (1976). In other 
words, the proper mailing and addressing of a letter creates a presumption of receipt 
but that presumption may be rebutted by evidence.  Stacey v Sankovich, 19 Mich App 
638 (1969); Good v Detroit Automobile Inter-Insurance Exchange, 67 Mich App 270 
(1976). Under the mailbox rule, evidence of business custom or usage is allowed to 
establish the fact of mailing without further testimony by an employee of compliance 
with the custom. Good, supra.  Such evidence is admissible without further evidence 
from the records custodian that a particular letter was actually mailed. Good supra at 
275. "Moreover, the fact that a letter was mailed with a return address but was not 
returned lends strength to the presumption that the letter was received." Id at 276. The 
challenging party may rebut the presumption that the letter was received by presenting 
evidence to the contrary. See id. 
 
Additionally, Claimant did not comply with the Verification Checklist.  Therefore, the 
Department followed policy in terminating benefits.   
 
The Administrative Law Judge, based on the above Findings of Fact and Conclusions of 
Law, and for the reasons stated on the record, if any, finds that the Department acted in 
accordance with Department policy when it terminated SDA and MA. 
 

DECISION AND ORDER 
 
Accordingly, the Department’s decision is AFFIRMED.  
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