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Department policies are contained in the Department of Human Services Bridges 
Administrative Manual (BAM), Department of Human Services Bridges Eligibility Manual 
(BEM), Department of Human Services Reference Tables Manual (RFT), and 
Department of Human Services Emergency Relief Manual (ERM).   
 
MA 
The Medical Assistance (MA) program is established by Title XIX of the Social Security 
Act, 42 USC 1396-1396w-5; 42 USC 1315; the Affordable Care Act of 2010, the 
collective term for the Patient Protection and Affordable Care Act, Pub. L. No. 111-148, 
as amended by the Health Care and Education Reconciliation Act of 2010, Pub. L. No. 
111-152; and 42 CFR 430.10-.25.  The Department (formerly known as the Family 
Independence Agency) administers the MA program pursuant to 42 CFR 435, MCL 
400.10, and MCL 400.105-.112k.   
 
The hearing was requested to dispute the Department’s action taken with respect to 
Claimant’s MA benefits. Shortly after commencement of the hearing, Claimant testified 
that she understands and is satisfied with the actions taken by the Department and that 
she no longer had any issues to address with respect to her MA case, as she had been 
approved for MA benefits. Claimant further stated that she did not wish to proceed with 
the hearing concerning her MA benefits. The Request for Hearing was withdrawn. The 
Department agreed to the dismissal of the hearing request. Pursuant to the withdrawal 
of the hearing request filed in this matter, the Request for Hearing is hereby 
DISMISSED.   

FAP 
The Food Assistance Program (FAP) [formerly known as the Food Stamp program] is 
established by the Food Stamp Act of 1977, as amended, 7 USC 2011 to 2036a and is 
implemented by the federal regulations contained in 7 CFR 273.  The Department 
(formerly known as the Family Independence Agency) administers FAP pursuant to 
MCL 400.10, the Social Welfare Act, MCL 400.1-.119b, and Mich Admin Code, R 
400.3001 to .3015. 
 
Additionally, people convicted of certain crimes, fugitive felons, and probation or parole 
violators are not eligible for assistance.  BEM 203 (July 2013), p. 1.  For FAP cases, an 
individual convicted of a felony for the use, possession, or distribution of controlled 
substances two or more times in separate periods will be permanently disqualified if 
both offenses occurred after August 22, 1996. BEM 203, p.2.  
 
In this case, the Department testified that in processing Claimant’s FAP application, it 
discovered that Claimant had been convicted of two drug related felonies, each of which 
occurred after August 22, 1996. The Department presented evidence from the Michigan 
Department of Corrections Offender Tracking Information System (OTIS), showing that 
on October 23, 2008, and June 7, 2011, Claimant was sentenced after a conviction for 
two different drug related felonies, as defined by MCL 333.7403(2)(a)(v) and MCL 






