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CONCLUSIONS OF LAW 
 

Department policies are contained in the Department of Human Service s Bridges  
Administrative Manual (BAM), Department of Human Services Bridges Eligibility Manual 
(BEM), D epartment of Human Servic es Reference Tables Manual (RFT), and 
Department of Human Services Emergency Relief Manual (ERM).   
 
The Food Assistance Program (FAP) [formerly  known as the Food Stamp program] i s 
established by the Food Stamp Act of 197 7, as amended, 7 USC 2011 to 2036a and is  
implemented by  the federal regulations c ontained in 7 CFR 271. 1 to 285.5.  The  
Department (formerly known as  the Fam ily Independence Agency) administers FAP 
pursuant to MCL 400.10 and Mich Admin Code, R 400.3001 to .3015. 
 
Additionally, a Claimant must cooperate wit h t he local office in determining initia l and 
ongoing eligibility, including c ompletion of necessary forms, and must completely an d 
truthfully answer all questions on forms and in interviews. BAM 105.   
 
Verification is usually requi red upon applic ation or redetermination and for a reporte d 
change affecting eligibility or benefit level.  Verifications are considered timely if  
received by the date they are due.  The Department must a llow a client 10 calendar 
days (or other time limit specified in policy)  to provide the requested verification.  The 
Department worker must tell the client what verification is required, how to obtain it, and 
the due date. The client must obtain requir ed verification, but the Department must 
assist if the client needs and requests help.   If neither the client nor the Dep artment can 
obtain v erification des pite a reas onable effor t, the Department worker should use the 
best available information. If no evidenc e is available, the Departmen t worker is to use 
their best judgment.  The Depar tment is to s end a case action notice when the client  
indicates refusal to provide a ver ification, or the time period given has elaps ed and the 
client has not made a reasonable effort to provide it.  BAM 130. 
 
For FAP, if the client cont acts the Department prior to the due date requesting an 
extension or assistance in obtaining verifications, the Department must assist them with 
the verifications but not grant an extens ion. The Department worker must explain to the 
client they will not be given an extens ion and their case will be denied once the due 
date is pas sed. Also, the Department worker s hall explain their elig ibility and it will b e 
determined based on their compliance date if they return required verifications. BAM  
130. The Department must re-register the F AP application if the client complies within 
60 days of the application date. BAM 115 and BAM 130. 
 
Regarding earned inc ome, the D epartment counts the gross amount of wages (exc ept 
as specified in poli cy regarding the earned income tax credi t, flexible benefit s, strikers’ 
countable earnings, student earn ings disregard, and census  workers).  BEM 501.   
Regarding assets, the Department counts funds in a s avings accounts as a cash asset.   
BEM 400. 
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On December 26, 2013, a Verification Check list was issued to Claimant stating wha t 
verifications were needed by the January 6, 2014 due d ate.  The requested verifications 
included proofs for: Claimant ’s checking and savings accounts, self-employment,  
wages, loss of employment, mortgage, and v ehicle owner ship; and Claimant’s  
daughter’s wages and checking account.  The Verification checklist also stated 
additional information should be  provided r egarding missing check stubs.  (Exhibit A, 
pages 27-28)  On December 27, 2013, Clai mant submitted some of the requested 
verifications.  (Exhibit A,  pages 39-65)  The Department  denied the FAP application 
because not all of the requested verifications were provided.  Specifically , the denial 
notice states the verifications not provided  were: Claimant’s savings account, loss o f 
employment and self-employment payments;  and Claimant’s daughter’s earned incom e 
and missing check stubs. (Exhibit A, page 68) 

Claimant testified he provided all that was available regarding his self-employment 
wages from working as a pastor.  Regarding wage verification, the Verification Checklist 
specified acceptable proofs were the la st 30 day s of chec k stubs or earnings  
statements, employer  statem ent, DHS-38 Verification of employment form, or DHS-
3569 Agricultural Income Verific ation form.  Claimant explained that for his work as a 
pastor, he only receiv es a check.  Claimant  stated there is no ear nings statement or 
paycheck stub, and nothing is withhe ld from the checks, such as taxes.  Accordingly, 
Claimant submitted what he could,  the copies of the actual check s for this employment.  
(Exhibit A, pages 41-42)  Pursuant to BAM 130, when a requested verification, such as  
paycheck stubs, is requested but is not available, the Department worker should use the 
best available information.  A denial notice is only  appropriate when the c lient indicates 
refusal to provide a verification, or the ti me period given has elapsed and the client has 
not made a reasonable effort to provide it.  Cl aimant did not refuse to provide requested 
verification of his income from working as  a pastor, rather Cla imant made a reasonable 
effort and provided the best available information for proof of this income.  The denial of  
the FAP applic ation should not have been based on a failure to provide verification of  
Claimant’s income as a pastor. 

It was uncontested that Claiman t only provided copies of  the checks, and not the 
paycheck stubs, for proof of  his daughter’s employ ment income.  Regarding wage 
verification, the Verification Checklist specified acceptable proofs were the last 30 day s 
of check stubs or earnings statements, employer statem ent, DHS-38 Verification of 
employment form, or DHS-3569 Agric ultural Income Verification form.  Claimant 
acknowledged he was not successful in getti ng the actual pay check stubs back to the 
Department.  Claimant testified he tried to pr ovide W2’s to the Department at the pre-
hearing conference but that did not satisfy them.  Cla imant noted the difference 
between the actual paychecks and the paycheck stubs showing the gross earnings was 
only about $  in wit hheld taxes.  Unlike Claimant’s income as a pastor discussed  
above where no actual paychec k stubs were available, the evi dence indicates that 
paycheck stubs were availabl e for his daughter’s income.   T he denial of the FAP 
application was in accordance with Depar tment policy based on Claimant ’s failure to 
provide requested acceptable verification, which was available, for his daughter’s wages 
by the due date listed on the Verification Checklist.     
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Claimant also failed to pr ovide any doc umentation in re sponse to the r equest for 
verification of his savings account.  Claimant testified that at time of the FAP application, 
he only had $  in the savings account.  Cla imant explained he is beh ind on the 
mortgage and by the time the Department r equested the verifications, the bank had 
already closed the savings account.  Theref ore, Claimant asserted there was no longer 
a savings  account to provide v erification of.  While the savings account  may have 
closed, it was open at time time  the FAP application was filed.   Accordingly, verification 
of the value this potential asset was needed to determine FAP eligibility back to the 
application date.  Claimant should have provided s ome documentation in response th e 
request for verification of the savings account, such as the last available bank statement 
with an explanation or proof of  when the bank closed the account.  The denial of the 
FAP application was in accordance with De partment policy based on Claimant’s failure 
to provide any docum entation in response to t he request for veri fication of his savings  
account. 

The Department provided sufficient evidence that they followed the BAM 130 policy in 
requesting verifications needed to determine F AP eligibility,  including ver ification of 
Claimant’s savings account and Claimant’s daughter’s earned income.  The Department 
allowed 10 days, told Claimant  what verifications were r equired, how to obtain them,  
and the due date.  There was no evidence Cla imant requested the Department assist  
with obtaining the r equested veri fications.  The submitted copies of  the actua l 
paychecks for Claimant’s daughter did not pr ovide sufficient information to verify her 
gross income.  The evidenc e indicates payc heck stubs were available f or Claimant’s 
daughter’s income, but were not submitted.  Regarding Claimant’s  savings account, it  
was uncontested that the accoun t existed at  the time of t he FAP application.   Claimant  
did not pr ovide any documentation in res ponse to the request  for verification of his 
savings account.  Accordingly, t he denial of Claimant’s FAP application based on th e 
failure to provide any verification of hi s savings account and failure to provide 
acceptable, available verification of his daughter’s wages must be upheld. 

The Administrative Law Judge, based on the above Findings of Fact and Conclusions of 
Law, and for the reasons stated on the record, if any, finds that the Department acted in 
accordance with Department policy when it denied Claimant’s FAP application based on 
a failure to comply with verification requirements. 
 

DECISION AND ORDER 
 
Accordingly, the Department’s decision is AFFIRMED.  
 

__________________________ 
Colleen Lack 

Administrative Law Judge 
for Maura Corrigan, Director 

Department of Human Services 
Date Signed:  March 4, 2014 
Date Mailed:   March 4, 2014 






