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implemented by  the federal regulations c ontained in 7 CFR 271.1 to 285.5.  The  
Department (formerly known as  the Fam ily Independence Agency) administers FAP 
pursuant to MCL 400.10 and Mich Admin Code, R 400.3001 to .3015. 

All earned and unearned income available to the Claimant is countable.  Earned income 
means income received from another person or organization or  from self-employment 
for duties for duties that were performed fo r compensation or profit.  Unearned incom e 
means all income that is not earned, including but not limited to funds received from the 
Family Independenc e Program (FIP), State Dis ability Ass istance (SDA), Child 
Development and Ca re (CDC), Medicaid ( MA), Social Security Benefits (RSDI/SSI), 
Veterans Administration (VA), Unemploy ment Compensation Benef its (UCB), Adu lt 
Medical Pr ogram (AMA), alimony, and child  support payments.  The amount counted 
may before than the client actually receives  because the gross amount is used prior to 
any deductions.  Department of Human Services Bridges Eligibility Manual (BEM) 500  
(July 1, 2013). 

The Claimant was an ongoing Food Ass istance Program (FAP) recipient when the 
Department conducted a routine review o f his eligib ility to receive contin uing Foo d 
Assistance Program (FAP) benefits.  The Cla imant receives monthly unearned incom e 
in the gross monthly amount of $998, whic h was an increase over previous months.   
The Claimant had no countable medical expens es for February of 2014, but did hav e 
countable medical expenses du ring previous months.  On  December 26, 2014, the 
Department notified t he Claimant that his monthly  al lotment of Food Assistanc e 
Program (FAP) benefits would be reduced to $21. 

The Claimant did not dispute the Department’s  determination of his current income, and 
failed to establish that he reported count able medical expens es not used by the 
Department to determine his Food Assistance Program (FAP) eligibility. 

Based on the evidence and testimony available during the hearing, the Department has 
established that it was acting in accor dance with policy when it reduced hi s Food 
Assistance Program (FAP) benefits effective February 1, 2014. 

DECISION AND ORDER 

The Administrative Law Judge, based on the above Findings of Fact and Conclusions of 
Law, and for the reasons stated on the record, if any, finds that the Department acted in 
accordance with Department policy when it determined the Claimant’s Food Assistance 
Program (FAP) eligibility. 
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Accordingly, the Department’s decision is AFFIRMED.  

 
 

 _______________________ 
 Kevin Scully 

 Administrative Law Judge 
 for Maura D. Corrigan, Director 
 Department of Human Services 

 
Date Signed:  January 31, 2014 
 
Date Mailed:   February 3, 2014 
 
 
NOTICE OF APP EAL:  The c laimant may appea l the Dec ision and Order to Circuit  
Court within 30 days  of the rece ipt of the Decision and Order or, i f a timely Request for  
Rehearing or Reconsideration was made, within 30 days of the receipt date of the 
Decision and Order of Reconsideration or Rehearing Decision. 
 
Michigan Administrative Hearing Syst em (MAHS) may order a rehearing  or 
reconsideration on either its own motion or at the request of a par ty within 30 days  of 
the mailing date of this Dec ision and Order .  MAHS will not order a rehearing or  
reconsideration on the Department's mo tion where the final decis ion cannot be 
implemented within 90 days of the filing of the original request (60 days for FAP cases). 
 
A Request for Rehearing or Reconsideration may be granted when one of the following 
exists: 
 

 Newly disc overed evidence that existed at  the time of the or iginal hearing that 
could affect the outcome of the original hearing decision; 

 Misapplication of manual policy or law in the hearing decision which led to a 
wrong conclusion; 

 Typographical, mathematical or other obvious error in the hearing decision that 
affects the rights of the client; 

 Failure of the ALJ to address in the hearing decision relevant issues raised in the 
hearing request. 

 
The Department, AHR or the clai mant must specify all reas ons for the request.  MAHS 
will not review any response to a request for rehearing/reconsideration.  A request must 
be received in MAHS within 30 days of the date the hearing decision is mailed. 
 
The written request must be faxed to (517) 335-6088 and be labeled as follows:  
 

Attention:  MAHS Rehearing/Reconsideration Request 
 
If submitted by mail, the written request must be addressed as follows: 
 

Michigan Administrative Hearings 






