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3. On June 17, 2013, the Department sent  Claimant a Notice of Case Action 
notifying her that her MA benefits would close effective July 1, 2013, ongoing,  
due to her failure to submit a redetermination.  Exhibit 1.  

 
4. On June 21, 2013, Claimant submitted a redetermination.  Exhibit 1.  

 
5. On June 28, 2013, Claimant filed a hear ing request, disputing her MA and Food 

Assistance Program (FAP) benefits.  Exhibit 1.  
 

CONCLUSIONS OF LAW 
 

Department policies are found in the Bridges Administrative Manual (BAM), the Bridges 
Eligibility Manual (BEM), the Reference Tables Manual (RFT), and the State Emergency 
Relief Manual (ERM). 
 

 The Medical Ass istance (MA) program is es tablished by the Title XIX of the Soc ial 
Security Act and is im plemented by Title 42 of  the Code of Federal Regu lations (CFR).  
The Department of Human Services (formerly known as the Family Independ ence 
Agency) administers the MA pr ogram pursuant to MCL 400.10, et seq ., and MC L 
400.105.   
 
As a preliminary matter, duri ng the hearing, Clai mant testified that  she is no long er 
protesting her FAP hearing request.  See Ex hibit 1.  Thus, Claimant’s June 28, 2013 
FAP hearing request is hereby DISMISSED.   
 
The law pr ovides that  dispos ition may be made of a contest ed case by s tipulation o r 
agreed settlement.  MCL 24.278(2).   
 
In the present case, Claimant  requested a hearing to dispute the Department’s action.   
Soon after commencement of th e hearing, the parties testif ied that they had reached a 
settlement concerning the disputed action.  Consequently, the Department agreed to do 
the following: initiate reinstatement of Claim ant’s MA case as of July 1, 2013, ongoing;  
begin recalculating the MA budget for Ju ly 1, 2013, ongoing, in accorda nce wit h 
Department policy; begin issuing supplements to Claimant fo r any MA benefits she was  
eligible to receive but did not from July 1, 2013, ongoing; and begin notifying Claimant in 
writing of its MA decision in accordance with Department policy. 
 
As a result of this settlement, Claimant no longer wish es to proceed with the hearing.   
As such, it is unnec essary for this Admi nistrative Law Judge to render a decis ion 
regarding the facts and issues in this case.   
 

DECISION AND ORDER 
 
The Administrative Law Judge concludes that the Department and Claiman t have come 
to a settlement regarding Claimant’s request for a hearing.   
 
THE DEPARTMENT I S ORDERED TO INITIA TE THE FOLLOWING ACTION WITHIN 
TEN DAYS OF THE MAILING DATE OF THIS ORDER: 






