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6. DHS failed to acknowledge receipt of Claimant’s Redetermination. 

 
7. On 6/25/13, Claimant requested a hearing to dispute the AMP termination. 

 
CONCLUSIONS OF LAW 

 
The Medical Assistance (MA) program is established by the Title XIX of the Social 
Security Act and is implemented by Title 42 of the Code of Federal Regulations (CFR). 
The Department of Human Services (formerly known as the Family Independence 
Agency) administers the MA program pursuant to MCL 400.10, et seq., and MCL 
400.105. DHS regulations are found in the Bridges Administrative Manual (BAM), the 
Bridges Eligibility Manual (BEM) and the Reference Tables Manual (RFT). 
 
The Adult Medical Program (AMP) is established by 42 USC 1315, and is administered 
by the Department pursuant to MCL 400.10, et seq. AMP is part of the MA benefit 
program. 
 
The present case concerns a termination of AMP benefits, effective 6/2013. It was not 
disputed that the basis for termination was Claimant’s alleged failure to return a 
Redetermination. It was also not disputed that Claimant failed to return the 
Redetermination to DHS by 5/17/13, the date that DHS initiated AMP benefit 
termination. 
 
For all programs, DHS must periodically redetermine an individual’s eligibility for active 
benefit programs. BAM 210 (11/2012), p. 1. A complete redetermination is required at 
least every 12 months. Id. The redetermination process begins with DHS mailing a 
redetermination packet in the month prior to the end of the benefit period. Id., p. 5. The 
packet consists of forms and requests for verification that are necessary for DHS to 
process the redetermination. The forms needed for redetermination may vary, though a 
Redetermination (DHS-1010) is an acceptable review form for all programs.  
 
For AMP redeterminations, verifications are due the same date as the redetermination/ 
review interview. Id., p. 11. Bridges gives timely notice of the negative action if the time 
limit is not met. Id. 
 
Claimant testified that he returned a Redetermination to DHS on 5/28/13. Two issues 
arose from Claimant’s testimony. The first was whether he returned a Redetermination 
to DHS on 5/28/13. 
 
Claimant noted in his written hearing request that he returned the Redetermination to 
DHS on 5/28/13 and that his specialist told him that he was “straight’. Claimant’s written 
statement was consistent with Claimant’s testimony. Generally, persons are more 
credible when they written statements are consistent with testimony. 
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Claimant brought his nephew to the hearing. Claimant’s nephew corroborated 
Claimant’s testimony. Generally, corroboration makes testimony more credible. 
 
Claimant also provided a fair amount of detail of how he submitted the Redetermination 
to DHS. Generally, more details increase the likelihood of testimony being credible. 
 
Claimant’s testimony was also not rebutted. Claimant’s specialist could have testified 
that she never received Claimant’s Redetermination or that she told Claimant that his 
paperwork was “straight”. No such testimony was presented. 
 
DHS presented testimony that all document submissions are logged by staff and that 
Claimant’s name did not appear on the log for 5/28/13. The specialist also testified that 
196 names were on the paperwork and that a computer search for Claimant’s name 
was not performed. This testimony tended to lessen Claimant’s credibility but it is 
problematic for DHS that a computer search was not performed. A computer search 
would have been more reliable and could have discovered if a submission was logged 
shortly before or after 5/28/13. 
 
Based on the presented evidence, it is found that Claimant submitted a Redetermination 
to DHS on 5/28/13. It must be then determined whether it was too late for Claimant to 
submit a Redetermination. 
 
Timely notice is given for a negative action unless policy specifies adequate notice or no 
notice. BAM 220 (11/2012), p. 4. A timely notice is mailed at least 11 days before the 
intended negative action takes effect. The action is pended to provide the client a 
chance to react to the proposed action. Id. 
 
It was not disputed that the DHS written notice of termination was mailed to Claimant on 
5/17/13. That would have given Claimant until 5/28/13 to return a Redetermination to 
DHS. Claimant happened to wait until the latest possible day to return a 
Redetermination to DHS, but the submission was technically timely enough for DHS to 
redetermine Claimant’s benefit eligibility. Accordingly, the AMP termination was 
improper. 
 

DECISION AND ORDER 
 
The Administrative Law Judge, based upon the above findings of fact and conclusions 
of law, finds that DHS improperly terminated Claimant’s AMP benefit eligibility. It is 
ordered that DHS: 
 

(1) redetermine Claimant’s AMP benefit eligibility, effective 6/2013, subject to the 
finding that Claimant timely returned a Redetermination to DHS; and 

(2) initiate a supplement of any benefits improperly not issued. 
 
 
 






