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CONCLUSIONS OF LAW 
 

The Medical Assistance (MA) program is established by Title XIX of the Social Security 
Act and is implemented by Title 42 of the Code of Federal Regulations (CFR). DHS 
administers the MA program pursuant to MCL 400.10, et seq., and MCL 400.105. 
Department policies are found in the Bridges Administrative Manual (BAM), the Bridges 
Eligibility Manual (BEM) and the Reference Tables Manual (RFT). 
 
The refugee assistance programs are federal programs which helps refugees to 
become self-sufficient after their arrival in the United States. Refugee Assistance 
Program has two components, Refugee Cash Assistance (RCA) and Refugee Medical 
Assistance (RMA).  
 
The present dispute only concerns RCA. It was not disputed that DHS denied RCA, 
effective 3/2013, on the basis that Claimant was not eligible for RCA after eight months 
in the United States. 
 
RCA and/or RMA is available only during the eight months immediately following the 
refugee’s date of entry into the U.S. or date asylum is granted. BEM 630 (11/2012), p. 1. 
It was not disputed that Claimant’s date of entry into the United States was 7/23/12. 
Claimant’s ninth full month in the U.S. was 3/2013.  
 
Claimant testified that he recently lost employment and has no income. Though 
Claimant’s circumstances are sympathetic, DHS does not offer RCA starting with the 
ninth month of United States residency. Based on the presented evidence, it is found 
that DHS properly terminated Claimant’s RCA eligibility, effective 3/2013. 

 
DECISION AND ORDER 

 
The Administrative Law Judge, based upon the above findings of fact and conclusions 
of law, finds that DHS properly terminated Claimant’s RCA benefit eligibility, effective 
3/2013. The actions taken by DHS are AFFIRMED. 
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NOTICE: Michigan Administrative Hearing System (MAHS) may order a rehearing or 
reconsideration on either its own motion or at the request of a party within 30 days of 
the mailing date of this Decision and Order. MAHS will not order a rehearing or  






