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CONCLUSIONS OF LAW 

The regulations governing the hearing and a ppeal process for applicants and recipients 
of public assistance in Michigan are found in  the Michigan Administrative Code, MAC R  
400.901-400.951.  An oppor tunity for a hearing shall be granted to an ap plicant wh o 
requests a hearing because his c laim for assistance is denied.  MAC R 400.903(1).  An 
opportunity for a hearing shall be granted to an applicant who requests  a hearing 
because of a denial.  MAC R 400.903(2).  
  
Clients have the right to c ontest a department decis ion affe cting eligibil ity or benefit 
levels whenever it is believed th e decision is incorrect.  BAM 600.  The dep artment will 
provide an adminis trative hearing to review the decis ion and determine the 
appropriateness.  BAM 600.   
 
The State Emergency Relief (S ER) program is established by 2004 PA 344.   The SER 
program is administer ed pursuant to MCL 400.10, et seq. , and by final administrative 
rules filed with the Secretary of State on October 28, 1993.  MAC R 400.7001-400.7049.  
Department of Human Services  (DHS or department) policies are found in the State 
Emergency Relief Manual (SER).   
 
SER assist s with burial when the decedent’s estate, mandatory co- pays, etc are not 
sufficient to pay for: 
 Burial 
 Cremation 
 Costs associated with donation of a body to a medical school. 
 
SER payments for burial services are only made if it will resolve t he emergency.  (ERM 
306).   
 
Based upon the unrebutted test imony of the Claimant  and the Department, I find the 
issue was resolved when the amount due was pai d in full by the Cla imant and/or other  
parties.  T here is no eviden ce the Depart ment was provi ded with verificat ion of the 
copayment amount being paid prior to the fu ll payment being made.  For t his reason,  
the Department cannot provi de assistance since the emer gency (burial pay ments) had 
been resolved.     
 

DECISION AND ORDER 
 
I find, based upon the above findings of fact  and conclusions of law that the Department 
did act in accordance with policy in determining the Claimant’s SER eligibility. 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 






