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(4) On September 27, 2012, Claimant submitted verification of her only 

checking or savings account at Saginaw County Employees Credit Union. 
 
(5) On October 8, 2012, Claimant’s Food Assistance Program (FAP) and 

State Emergency Relief (SER) application were denied and her Medical 
Assistance (MA) and Medicare Cost Share program were closed for 
failure to provide required verifications. 

  
(6) On October 26, 2012, Claimant submitted a request for hearing. 

 
CONCLUSIONS OF LAW 

 
The Food Assistance Program (FAP) (formerly known as the Food Stamp (FS) 
program) is established by the Food Stamp Act of 1977, as amended, and is 
implemented by the federal regulations contained in Title 7 of the Code of 
Federal Regulations (CFR).  The Department of Human Services (DHS or 
department) administers the FAP program pursuant to MCL 400.10, et seq., and 
MAC R 400.3001-3015.  Department policies are found in the Bridges 
Administrative Manual (BAM), the Bridges Eligibility Manual (BEM) and the 
Program Reference Manual (PRM).  
 
The basis for denying the application is verification of accounts at Saginaw 
Medical Federal Credit Union. Claimant previously had accounts there but the 
accounts are closed. The evidence in this record contains a statement for those 
accounts for September 2010. Claimant testified that she does not remember 
exactly when she closed the accounts but believes it was in late 2010 or early 
2011. Claimant’s eligibility summary shows that she has been the recipient of 
Medical Assistance (MA) benefits since 2010 and received Food Assistance 
Program (FAP) benefits between November 2010 and October 2011. The 
eligibility summary also shows that Claimant’s Medical Assistance (MA) and MC-
QMB eligibility were re-determined on May 23, 2012.  
 
It is certainly necessary to verify closure of accounts which have been reported to 
DHS during the course of a client’s receipt of benefits. However, denial of an 
application or closure of a program for failure to provide verification should be 
limited to required verifications. The facts and evidence in this case do not 
indicate that the Department needed an initial verification of the Saginaw Medical 
Federal Credit Union account closures in September 2012 or another verification 
of the closures. If verification of the closure had not already occurred, the 
Department’s May 23, 2012 determination of Claimant’s Medical Assistance (MA) 
eligibility would have required the verification to determine her asset eligibility. 
The Department has not submitted sufficient evidence to show that verification of 
the Saginaw Medical Federal Credit Union account closures was required to 
process Claimant’s September 11, 2012 application for Food Assistance 
Program (FAP) benefits. 
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DECISION AND ORDER 
 
The Administrative Law Judge, based upon the above findings of fact and 
conclusions of law, decides the Department of Human Services DID NOT 
properly deny Claimant’s September 11, 2012 Food Assistance Program (FAP) 
application for failure to provide required verifications. 
 
It is ORDERED that the actions of the Department of Human Services, in this 
matter, are REVERSED.  
 
It is further ORDERED that Claimant’s September 11, 2012 application for Food 
Assistance Program (FAP) benefits be reinstated and processed in accordance 
with Department policy. 

 
 

 /s/_____________________________ 
      Gary F. Heisler 

 Administrative Law Judge 
 for Maura D. Corrigan, Director 
 Department of Human Services 

 
 
Date Signed: January 24, 2013 
 
Date Mailed: January 24, 2013 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 






