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federal regulations contained in Title 7 of the Code of Federal Regulations (CFR).  The 
Department (formerly known as the Family Independence Agency) administers FAP 
pursuant to MCL 400.10, et seq., and 1997 AACS R 400.3001-3015.   
 
In this case the Department denied Claimant’s Food Assistance Program (FAP) 
application based on a Criminal Justice Disqualification of having two or more felony 
drug related conditions. The Department based the determination on statements made 
by Claimant. The Department did not have any specific, competent evidence regarding 
Claimant’s criminal conviction record. Claimant testified that she had numerous 
drug-related criminal charges but that she did not think any of them were felony 
convictions. A detailed analysis of the evidence presented, applicable Department 
policies, and reasoning for the decision are contained in the recorded record. During the 
hearing the Department was informed of the decision and the reasoning behind the 
decision. 
 

DECISION AND ORDER 
 

The Administrative Law Judge, based upon the above Findings of Fact and Conclusions 
of Law, and for the reasons stated on the record, finds that the Department DID NOT 
properly deny Claimant’s December 14, 2012 Food Assistance Program (FAP) 
application. 
 
It is ORDERED that the actions of the Department of Human Services, in this matter, 
are REVERSED.  
 
It is further ORDERED that Claimant’s December 14, 2012 Food Assistance Program 
(FAP) application be reinstated and processed in accordance with Department policy.  
 
 
 
 

 
Gary F. Heisler 

Administrative Law Judge 
For Maura Corrigan, Director 

Department of Human Services 
Date Signed:  February 27, 2013 
 
Date Mailed:   February 28, 2013 
 
NOTICE:  Michigan Administrative Hearing System (MAHS) may order a rehearing or 
reconsideration on either its own motion or at the request of a party within 30 days of 
the mailing date of this Decision and Order.  MAHS will not order a rehearing or 
reconsideration on the Department's motion where the final decision cannot be 
implemented within 90 days of the filing of the original request.   






