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5. On August 25, 2012, the Department sent a “Notice to Apply” to Claimant 
instructing her to file an application for Supplemental Security Income (“SSI”) by 
September 4, 2012.  (Exhibit 1, p. 2) 

 
6. On October 22, 2012, the Department denied Claimant’s MA application based 

on the failure to pursue benefits with a third party organization.   
 

7. On October 10, 2012, the Department received Claimant’s written request for 
hearing.   

 
CONCLUSIONS OF LAW 

 
Department policies are contained in the Bridges Administrative Manual (“BAM”), the 
Bridges Eligibility Manual (“BEM”), and the Reference Tables (“RFT”).   
 
The Medical Assistance (“MA”) program is established by the Title XIX of the Social 
Security Act and is implemented by Title 42 of the Code of Federal Regulations (“CFR”).  
The Department of Human Services, formerly known as the Family Independence 
Agency, administers the MA program pursuant to MCL 400.10, et seq., and MCL 
400.105.   
 
As a condition of eligibility, applicants and recipients must take all necessary steps to 
obtain benefits for which they may be eligible.  42 CFR 435.608(a); BEM 270 (June 
2012), p. 1.  Failure to do so results in the person’s MA ineligibility.  BEM 270, p. 1.     
 
In this case, Claimant submitted an application for MA benefits on August 2, 2012.  At 
this point, the SSA had found Claimant not disabled.  Claimant appealed the SSA 
determination which ultimately resulted in the June 20, 2011 ALJ determination which 
found the Claimant not disabled.  Claimant was unclear as to the date the Appeal’s 
Council affirmed the ALJ decision but testified she was preparing to file (through her 
attorney) and new SSA case.   
 
In processing the August 2, 2012 MA application, the Department requested verification 
that the Claimant was pursing potential benefits with the SSA.  Claimant did not submit 
the requested verification.  On October 22, 2012, the Department confirmed via the 
SOLQ, that a new application had not been filed by the Claimant with the SSA.  
Because there was not a pending application filed with the SSA, the Department denied 
Claimant’s application on October 22nd based on the failure to pursue potential benefits.   
 
Ultimately, the Department established it acted in accordance with Department policy 
when it denied Claimant’s MA application based on the failure to pursue potential 
benefits as requested.        
 
 






