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4. The Claimant conceded at the hearing that she did not dispute that she had received 
60 months of FIP cash assistance.   

 
5. On February 18, 2013 Claim ant filed a Request for Hearing, disputing the 

Department’s action which clos ed her FIP ca se due to expiration of the 60 month 
limit.     

CONCLUSIONS OF LAW 
 
The Family  Independence Program (FIP) was established pursuant to the Personal 
Responsibility and W ork Opportunity Reconc iliation Act of 1996, Public Law 104-193,  
42 USC 601, et seq .  The Department (formerly k nown as the Family Independe nce 
Agency) administers FIP pursuant to MCL 400.10, et seq ., and Mich Admin Code, R 
400.3101 t hrough R 400.3131.  FI P replaced the Aid to Dependent Children (ADC) 
program effective October 1, 1996.  Departm ent policies are contained in the Bridges  
Administrative Manual (BAM), the Bridges Eligibility Manual (BEM), and the Referenc e 
Tables Manual (RFT).   
 
FIP is not an entitlement.  BEM  234.  Time limits are ess ential to establish ing the 
temporary nature of aid as well as communicating the FIP philosophy to support a 
family’s movement to self-sufficiency.  BEM 234.  BEM 234 restricts the total cumulative 
months that an individual may receive FIP benefits to a lifeti me limit of 48  months for 
state-funded FIP cases and 60 months for federally-funded FIP cases.  On January 9,  
2013 a Department Bulletin was issued reinstating the 60 month time limit policy.  To be 
eligible, the FIP group cannot  include an adult who has accumulated more that 60 
TANF funded months beginning October 1, 1996.  The Claimant did not meet any of the 
exemptions for Work First par ticipation; that she was ex empt from the path program 
(Work First) due to incapacity or that she was incapacitated more than 90 days as the 
Claimant was no longer  deferred from attending Work  First as she was  found wor k 
ready in October 2012 by t he MRT and assigned to attend Work First.  During t he 
hearing the Claimant indicated that she did attend a Work First orientation on February 
11, 2013 but was turned away  due to us e of a cane.  Exhibit 3.  These facts are 
irrelevant to the outcome as the Claimant’s FIP case was terminated due to the fact that 
she was  no longer deferred from attending Work Fir st as of the MRT decision, not 
because she failed to attend the Work First pr ogram.   Exhibit 2.  BPB 2013-06 (March 
1, 2013) 
 
Additionally, the proofs sumbitted by the Department demonstrated that the Claimant 
received 60 months of F ederal FIP benefits and the Cla imant agreed that she had 
received 60 months of benefits.   Therefore the Department has met its burden of proof  
and has demonstrated that it properly closed the Claimant’s FIP case.  
 

DECISION AND ORDER 
 

The Administrative Law Judge, based upon the above Findings of Fact and Conclusions 
of Law, and for the reasons stated on the record, finds that the Department  

 did act properly    did not act properly  
when it closed Claimant’s FIP case. 
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