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 (5) On April 18, 2013,  the State H earing Review T eam (SHRT) found 
Claimant was not disabled indicati ng she was capable of performing 
sedentary work.  (Depart Ex. B, pp 1-2). 

 
 (6) Claimant has a history of bipolar disorder, anxiety, panic attacks, neck and 

shoulder pain, blurry vision, migraines , vertigo, diverticulitis, and num b 
toes. 

 
 (7) Claimant is a 44 y ear old woman whos e birthday  is .  

Claimant is 5’6” tall and weighs 195 lbs.  Claimant completed high school.   
 
 (8) Claimant was appealing the denial of Social Security disability benefits at 

the time of the hearing.   
 

CONCLUSIONS OF LAW 

The Medic al Assistance (MA) program is est ablished by the Title XIX of the Socia l 
Security Act and is im plemented by Title 42 of  the Code of Federal Regulations (CFR).   
The Department of Human Services (formerly known as the Family Independ ence 
Agency) administers the MA program pursuant to MCL 400.10, et seq ., and MC L 
400.105.  Department polic ies are found in the Bri dges Administrative Manual (BAM), 
the Bridges Eligibility Manual (BEM) and the Reference Tables Manual (RFT). 
 
The State Disability A ssistance (SDA) program which pr ovides financial ass istance for 
disabled persons is established by 2004 PA 344.  The Department of Human Service s 
(DHS or department) admin isters the SDA program pursuant to MCL 400.10, et seq. , 
and Mich Admin Code, Rules 400.3151-400.3180.  Department policies are found in the 
Bridges Administrative Manual (BAM), th e Bridges Eligibilit y Manual (BEM) and the 
Reference Tables Manual (RFT).   
 
Current legislative amendments to the Act delineate eligibility criteria as implemented by 
department policy set forth in program manual s.  2004 PA 344, Se c. 604, es tablishes 
the State Disability Assistance program.  It reads in part: 

 
Sec. 604 (1). The department sha ll operate a state di sability 
assistance program.  Except as  provided in subsection (3), 
persons eligible for this program shall includ e needy cit izens 
of the United States or aliens exempt from the Supplemental 
Security Income citizenship re quirement who are at least 18 
years of age or emanc ipated minors meeting one or m ore of 
the following requirements: 
 
(b)  A per son with a physical or mental impairment whic h 
meets federal SSI disab ility standards, exce pt that the 
minimum duration of the dis ability shall be 90 days.  
Substance abuse alone is not defined as a basis for 
eligibility. 
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Specifically, this Act provides minimal cash assistance to indiv iduals with some type of  
severe, temporary disability which prevents him or her from engaging in substantial 
gainful work activity for at least ninety (90) days. 
 
Disability is defined as the inability to do any substantial gainful activity by reason of any 
medically determinable phys ical or mental im pairment which can be e xpected to result  
in death or  which has  lasted or can be expect ed to last for a continuous period of not 
less than 12 months.  20 CFR 416.905(a).  The person claimi ng a physical or mental 
disability has the burden to esta blish it th rough the use of competent medical evidenc e 
from qualified medical sources such as his  or  her medical history,  clinica l/laboratory 
findings, diagnosis/prescri bed treatment, prognosis for recovery and/or medical 
assessment of ability to do work-related ac tivities o r ability to reason and make  
appropriate mental adjustments, i f a mental disab ility is alleged.  20 CRF 413 .913.  An 
individual’s subjective pain com plaints ar e not, in and of themselves, sufficient to 
establish disab ility.  20 CF R 416.908; 2 0 CFR 4 16.929(a).  Similarly,  conclusor y 
statements by a physician or mental health professional that an individual is disabled or 
blind, absent supporting medical evidence, is insufficient to establish disability.  20 CFR 
416.927. 
 
When determining disability, t he federal regulations  require several factors to be 
considered including: (1) the location/duration/frequency/intensity of an applicant’s pain;  
(2) the type/dosage/effectiveness/side effects of  any medication t he applicant takes to 
relieve pain; (3) any treatment other t han pain medication that the applicant has  
received to relieve pain; and, (4) the effect of  the applicant’s pain on his or her ability to 
do basic work activities.  20 CFR 416.929(c)(3).  The applicant’s pain must be assessed 
to determi ne the ext ent of his or her functi onal limitation(s) in light of the objective 
medical evidence presented.  20 CFR 416.929(c)(2).  
 
In order to determine whether or not an individual is disabled, federal regulations require 
a five-step sequentia l evaluation process be utilized.  20 CFR 416 .920(a)(1).  The five-
step analysis requires the trier of fact to cons ider an  individual’s current work activit y; 
the severity of the impairment(s) both in duration and whether it meets or equals a listed 
impairment in Appendix 1; residual functional capacity  to det ermine whether an 
individual c an perform past relev ant work; and residual functiona l ca pacity along with 
vocational factors (e.g., age, education, and work experienc e) to determine if an 
individual can adjust to other work.  20 CFR 416.920(a)(4); 20 CFR 416.945. 
 
If an individual is found disabled, or not disabled, at any step, a determination or  
decision is made with no need to evaluate s ubsequent steps.  20 CFR 416.920(a)(4).  If 
a determination cannot be made that an individual is disabl ed, or not disabled, at a 
particular step, the next step is required.  20 CFR 416.920 (a)(4).  If an impairment does  
not meet or equal a listed impairment, an indi vidual’s residual functional capacity is 
assessed before moving from Step 3 to St ep 4.  20 CFR 416.920(a)(4); 20 CFR 
416.945.  Residual f unctional capacity is the most an indiv idual can do d espite the 
limitations based on all relevant  evidence.  20 CF R 945(a)(1).  An ind ividual’s residual 
functional capacity assessment is evaluat ed at both Steps 4 and 5.  20 CFR 
416.920(a)(4).  In determining disability, an i ndividual’s functional capac ity to perform  
basic work activities is evaluated and if found that the individ ual h as the ability to  
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perform basic work activities without significant limitation, disability will not be found.  20 
CFR 416.994(b)(1)(iv).  In general, the indi vidual has the responsibility to prove 
disability.  20 CFR 4 16.912(a).  An impairment or combi nation of impairments is not 
severe if it does not signific antly limit an i ndividual’s physical or m ental ability to do 
basic work activities.   20 CFR 416.921(a ).  The in dividual ha s the resp onsibility t o 
provide evidence of prior work experience; e fforts to work; and any other factor showing 
how the impairment affects the ability to work.  20 CFR 416.912(c)(3)(5)(6).   
 
As outlined above, the first step looks at the i ndividual’s current work activity.  In the 
record presented, Claimant is not involved in substantial gainful activity and testified that 
she has not worked since October, 2012.  T herefore, she is not  disqualified from 
receiving disability benefits under Step 1. 
 
The severity of the individ ual’s alleged impairment(s) i s considered under Step 2.  The 
individual bears the burden to present suffi cient objective medical evidenc e to 
substantiate the alleged disa bling impairments.  In order to be considered disabled for  
MA purpos es, the impairment must be se vere.  20 CFR 916. 920(a)(4)(ii); 20 CFR 
916.920(b).  An impairment, or co mbination of impairments, is severe if it signific antly 
limits an in dividual’s physical or  mental ability to do basic wo rk activities regardless of 
age, education and work exper ience.  20 CFR 916.920(a)(4)(ii); 20 CFR 916.920(c).   
Basic work activities means the abilities and aptitudes necessar y to do most jobs.  20 
CFR 916.921(b).  Examples include: 

 
1. Physical functions such as  walk ing, standing, sitting, 

lifting, pushing, pulling, reaching, carrying, or 
handling; 

 
2. Capacities for seeing, hearing, and speaking; 
 
3. Understanding, carrying out, and remembering simple 

instructions; 
 
4. Use of judgment; 
 
5. Responding appropriately to supervision, co-workers 

and usual work situations; and  
 
6. Dealing with changes in a routine work setting.  Id.   

 
The second step allows for dismissal of a di sability claim obviously lacking in medical 
merit.  Higgs v Bowen, 880 F2d 860, 862 ( CA 6, 1988).  The severity requirement may 
still be employed as an admin istrative convenience to screen o ut claims that are totally  
groundless solely from a medical standpoint.  Id. at 863 citing Farris v Sec of Health and 
Human Services, 773 F2d 85, 90 n.1 (CA 6, 1985).  An impairment qualif ies as non-
severe only if, regardless of a claimant’s  age, education, or work experience, the 
impairment would not affect the claimant’s ability to work.  Salmi v Sec  of Health and  
Human Services, 774 F2d 685, 692 (CA 6, 1985).  
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In the present case, Claimant alleges dis ability due t o bipolar disorder, anxiety, panic  
attacks, ne ck and shoulder pain, blurry vision,  migraines, vertigo, diverticulitis, and 
numb toes.   
 
On April 30, 2012, Claimant received a W ork Releas e from  

 indicating she could return to work on 5/2/12 with restrictions  of no lifting over  
10 pounds for one week.  Diagnosis was tension headaches.    
 
On May 1, 2012, Claimant was seen by he r treating physician w ho took Claimant off 
work from 5/1/12 to 5/7/12, with a return to work d ate of 5/8/12, due to recurring 
headaches that prevented her from focusing and concentrating.    
 
On September 4, 2012, Claimant ’s podiatrist wrote out a Disability Certificate for  
Claimant indicating s he was totally  incapaci tated and was  to continue the restrictions  
set by her doctor’s office and return for re-evaluation on 9/18/12.   
 
On September 18, 2012, Claimant was cleared to return to her regular duties at work on 
9/19/12, with no restrictions, even with the off loading pad attached to the bottom of her  
left foot.   
 
On October 29, 2012, Claimant underwent an initial evaluation at  

  A  social worker di agnosed Claimant with General ized Anxiety Disorder and 
Major Depressive Dis order.  The social worker opined that Claimant has unresolved 
issues sur rounding t he death of her grandpar ents and rejection by her  parents.  
Claimant feels soc ially is olated and has mood swings.  She has erratic sleeping 
patterns and also has  feelings of  low self-w orth.  Claimant worries and is preoccupied 
by her health.  She has taken a lot of medication and now has been referred to a 
psychiatrist as the symptoms are seen as  somatic in nature.  She has headaches , 
bowel problems, and becomes nauseous and vomits.  The anxiety has been goin g on 
since she was 8 years old.   
 
On November 14, 2012, an MRI  of Claimant’s left foot rev ealed a plantar plate rupture 
2nd metatarsal phalangeal joint versus capsulitis in her left foot.    
 
On January 25, 2013, Claimant’s treating psychiatrist wrote t hat Claimant is receiving 
mental health counseling and medi cation for her psychiatric diso rder.  At this time, she 
is unable to work at her job.  Her return to work date is unknown.   
 
On March 26, 2013, Claimant underwent a medical evaluation on behalf of the  

   Claimant  presented with depression, anxiet y, migraines, nec k 
pain, shoulder pain, panic atta cks, diverticulitis, blurred vi sion, fatigue, racing thoughts 
and foot pain.  She had mild atrophy of her right upper ex tremity, especially around the 
wrist.  She had weakness of grip on the right  side compared to the left.  Tinel’s and  
Phalen’s signs were positive on t he right.  The physician opined that she should still be 
able to open jars, button clothing, write legi bly, pick up coins and tie shoelaces.  She  
had difficulty walking on her left foot due to  the plantar plate rupture of the 2 nd 
metatarsal phalangeal joint.  As a result, she c ould not walk heel to toe, on her heels or  
on her toes.  She was able to s quat only pa rt of the way down and get back up.  The 
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physician indicated that Claim ant may have carpal tunnel syndrome on her right hand.   
She was being treated for migraines and c omplained of neck and shoulder pain whic h 
may indicate a possibility of cervical radiculopathy.   
 
On May 2 2, 2013, Claimant’s  psychiatrist comp leted a Certification of Health Care 
Provider for Associate’s Serious Health  Condition form on behalf of Claimant.  The 
psychiatrist indicated he began t reating Claimant  in October, 2012, and that she has 
had the condition since she was approximately 8 years old.  H e noted the condition  
would continue until approximately Novem ber, 2013.   The psychiatrist opined that  
Claimant was unable to interact with other associates  at this time due to her bipolar  
disorder with hypomanic and major depressive  disor der.  Claimant’s symptoms w ere 
mood swings, hypomanic and major depressive  disorder, erratic sleep patterns, 
depression, anxiety, scared and stressed at work, decreased energy, crying spells, 
increased appetite with weight gain, isolating and health pr oblems.  The psychiatrist  
opined that Claimant has great difficulty performing her job at this time.   
 
As previously noted, Claimant bears the burden to pr esent sufficient objec tive medical 
evidence to substantiate the alleged disab ling impair ment(s).  As summarized abov e, 
Claimant has presented some limited medical evidence establishing that she does have 
some physical and mental limitations on her ability to perform basic work activities.  The 
medical ev idence has  established that Cla imant has an impair ment, or combination 
thereof, that has more than a de minimis  effect on Claimant’s  basic  wor k activities.  
Further, the impairments have lasted conti nuously for twelve months; therefore, 
Claimant is not disqualified from receipt of MA-P benefits under Step 2. 
 
In the third step of the seque ntial an alysis of a d isability c laim, the trier of fact must 
determine if the indiv idual’s impairment, or combination of impairme nts, is listed in  
Appendix 1 of Subpart P of 20 CF R, Part 404.  Claim ant has  alleged physical and 
mental disabling impairments due to bipolar disorder , anxiety, panic attacks, neck and 
shoulder pain, blurry vision, migraines, vertigo, diverticulitis, and numb toes.   
 
Listing 1.00 (musculoskeletal system), Listi ng 2.00 (special senses and speech), Listing 
5.00 (digestive system), Listing 8.00 (skin disorders), Listing 11.00 (neurological), and 
Listing 12. 00 (mental disorders), were consi dered in light of the objective evidenc e.  
Based on the foregoing, it is found that Claimant’s impairment(s) does no t meet the 
intent and severity requirement of a list ed impairment; therefore,  Claimant cannot be 
found disabled at Step 3.  Acco rdingly, Claimant’s eligibility is considered under Step 4.  
20 CFR 416.905(a). 
 
The fourth step in analyzing a disability claim requires an assessment of the individual’s 
residual f unctional capacity (“RFC”) and past relevant em ployment.  20 CF R 
416.920(a)(4)(iv).  An individual is not disabled if he/she can perform past relevant work.  
Id.; 20 CFR 416.960(b)(3).  Past relevant work  is work  that has been performed within  
the past 15 years that was a substantial gainful activity and that lasted long enough for  
the indiv idual to lear n the position.  20 CFR 416.960(b)(1).  Vocational fact ors of age, 
education, and work experience, and whet her t he past relevant  employment exists in 
significant numbers in the national economy are not considered.  20 CFR 416.960(b)(3).  
RFC is as sessed based on impairment(s) and any r elated symptoms, such as pain,  
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which may cause physical and mental limitations that affect what can be done in a work 
setting.  RFC is the most that can be done, despite the limitations.   
 
To determine the physical demands (exertional  requir ements) of work in the national 
economy, jobs are c lassified as sedentary, light, medium, heavy, and very heavy.  2 0 
CFR 416.967.  Sedentary work i nvolves lifting of no more than 10 pounds at a time and 
occasionally lifting or carrying articles like docket files, ledgers, and small tools.  20 CFR 
416.967(a).  Although a sedentary j ob is defined as one which involves sitting, a certain 
amount of walk ing and standing is often necessary in  carrying out job duties .  Id.  Jobs 
are sedentary if walking and standing are r equired occasionally  and other sedentary  
criteria are met.  Light work involves lifting no more than 20 pounds at a time with 
frequent lifting or carrying objects weighing up to 10 pounds.  20 CFR 416.967(b).  Even 
though weight lifted may be very little, a job is in this category when it requires a good 
deal of walking or standing, or when it invo lves sit ting most of the time with some 
pushing and pulling of  arm or leg controls.  Id.  To be considered capable of performing 
a full or wide range of light work, an indiv idual must have the ability to do substantially  
all of these activities .  Id.  An individual capable of light  work is also capable of 
sedentary work, unless there are additional limiting factors such as loss of fine dexterity  
or inability to sit for long periods of time.  Id.  Medium work involves lifting no more than 
50 pounds at a time with frequent lifting or carrying of objects weighing up to 25 pounds.  
20 CFR 416.967(c).  An individual capable of  performing medium work is also capable 
of light and sedentary work.  Id.  Heavy work involves lifting no more than 100 pounds at 
a time with frequent lifting or carrying of objects weighing up to 50 pounds.  20 CFR 
416.967(d).  An individual capab le of heavy work is also capable of medium, light, and 
sedentary work.  Id.  Finally, very heavy work involves lifting objects weighing more than 
100 pounds at a time with frequent lifting or carrying objects weighing 50 pounds or  
more.  20 CFR 416.967(e).  An individual c apable of very heavy work is able to perform  
work under all categories.  Id.   
 
Limitations or restrictions which affect the ability to meet the demands of jobs other than 
strength demands (exertional r equirements, e.g., si tting, standing, walking, lifting , 
carrying, pushing, or pulling) are consider ed nonexertional.  20 CFR 416.969a(a).  In 
considering whether an individual can perfo rm past relevant work, a comparis on of the 
individual’s residual functional  capacity to the demands  of past relevant work  must be 
made.  Id.  If an individual can no longer do past relevant work, the same residual 
functional capacity assessment  along wit h an individual’s age,  education, and work 
experience is cons idered to determine whet her an individual can adju st to other work  
which exist s in the national economy.  Id.  Examples of non-exer tional limitations or 
restrictions include difficulty functioni ng due to nervousness,  an xiousness, or 
depression; difficulty maintainin g attention or concent ration; difficulty understanding  or  
remembering detailed instructions; difficulty in  seeing or hearing; difficulty tolerating 
some physical feature(s) of certa in work setti ngs (e.g., can’t tolerate dust or fumes); or  
difficulty performing the manipulative or po stural functions of some work such as  
reaching, handling , stooping, climbin g, crawlin g, or crouchin g.  20 CF R 
416.969a(c)(1)(i) – (vi).  If the impairment(s) and related symptoms, such as pain, only  
affect the ability to perform  the non-exertional aspec ts of work-related activities, the 
rules in Appendix 2 do not direc t factual conc lusions of disabled or  not dis abled.  20 
CFR 416.969a(c)(2).  The dete rmination of whether disability exists is based upon the 
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principles in the appropriate sections of the regulations, giving consideration to the rules 
for specific case situations in Appendix 2.  Id.   
 
Claimant’s prior work history co nsists of work as a pr oduce c lerk, test driver and deli 
clerk.  In light of Claimant’s  testimony, and in considerat ion of the Occupational Code,  
Claimant’s prior work is classified as unskilled, light work.   
 
Claimant testified that s he is able to walk short distances and can lift/carry  
approximately 10 to 15 pounds .  The objective  medical evidence notes limitations i n 
heel and t oe walk ing, and squatting.  If the impairment or combination of impairments 
does not limit an individual’s physical or mental ability to do basic work activities, it is not 
a severe impairment(s) and disability does not exist.  20 CFR 416.920.  In consideration 
of Claimant’s testimony, medical records, and current limitations, Claimant can be found 
able to return to past relevant work.  Acco rdingly, Step 5 of t he sequential analys is is  
not required but it will be evaluated.     
 
In Step 5, an assessment of the individua l’s residual functional capac ity and age , 
education, and work experience is consider ed to determine whet her an adjustment to 
other work can be made.  20 CFR 416.920( 4)(v).  At the time of h earing, Claimant was 
44 years old and was, thus, considered to be  a younger individual for MA-P purposes.   
Claimant has a high school education.  Disabi lity is found if an indiv idual is unable t o 
adjust to other work.  Id.  At this point in the analys is, the burden shifts from Claimant to 
the Department to present proof  that Claimant has the residual  capacity to substantial 
gainful em ployment.  20 CFR 416.960(2); Richardson v Sec of Health and Hum an 
Services, 735 F2d 962, 964 (CA 6, 1984).  While a vocational ex pert is not required, a 
finding supported by substantia l evidence that the indiv idual has the vocational 
qualifications to perform specific jobs is needed to meet the burden.  O’Banner v Sec of 
Health and Human Services , 587 F2d 321, 323 (CA 6, 1978) .  Medical-Vocationa l 
guidelines found at 20  CFR Subpart P, Appendix II, may be used to satisf y the burden 
of proving that the individual can perform specific jobs in the national economy.  Heckler 
v Campbell, 461 US 458, 467 (1983); Kirk v Secretary , 667 F2d 524, 529 (CA 6, 1981) 
cert den 461 US 957 (1983).  The age for younger  individuals (under  50) generally wil l 
not seriously affect the ability to adjust to other work.  20 CFR 416.963(c). 
  
In this cas e, the evidence reveals that Clai mant suffers from bipolar disorder, anxiety, 
panic attac ks, neck and shoulder pain, blur ry vision, migraines, vertigo, div erticulitis, 
and numb toes.  The objective medical evidence notes limitations in heel to toe walk ing, 
and squatting.  Had Claimant not been found able t o return to past relev ant work, 
Claimant would have been found to maintain the res idual functional c apacity for work  
activities on a regular and continuing basis  which includes the ability to meet the 
physical and mental dem ands required to perform at least light work as defined in 20  
CFR 416.967(b), using the M edical-Vocational Guidelines  [20 CFR 404, Subpart P, 
Appendix II] as a guide, specifically Rule 202.20.   
 
While it is  noted that Claim ant’s treating psychiatrist has taken opined Claimant is  
unable to work until November, 2013, conclu sory statements by a mental health  
professional that an i ndividual is disabled or blind, ab sent supporting medical evidence, 
is insufficient to establis h disability.  20 CFR 416.927.  Absent  the psychiatrist’s  
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conclusory opinion, t here was no supporting medical evidence offered to sufficiently 
establish disability. 
 

DECISION AND ORDER 
 
The Administrative Law Judge, based on the above findings of fact and conclusions of 
law, finds  Claimant not disa bled for purpos es of the MA -P/Retro-MA and SDA benef it 
programs.  
 
Accordingly, it is ORDERED: 
 
The Department’s determination is AFFIRMED. 
 

  
               Vicki L. Armstrong 

          Administrative Law Judge 
          for Maura D. Corrigan, Director 
          Department of Human Services 

 
 
 
Date Signed: June 25, 2013 
 
Date Mailed: June 25, 2013 
 
NOTICE:  Administrative Hearings may or der a rehearing or  reconsideration on either  
its own motion or at t he request  of a party wit hin 30 days of the ma iling date of this 
Decision and Order.  Administrative Hear ings will not orde r a rehearing or  
reconsideration on the Department's mo tion where the final decis ion cannot be 
implemented within 90 days of the filing of the original request.   
 
The Claimant may appeal the Decision and Order  to Circuit Court within 30 days of the 
mailing of the Decis ion and Order or, if a ti mely request for rehearing was made, within  
30 days of the receipt date of the rehearing decision. 
 
Claimant may request a rehearing or reconsideration for the following reasons: 
 

 A rehearing MAY be granted if there is newly discovered evidence that 
could affect the outcome of the original hearing decision. 

 A reconsideration MAY be granted for any of the following reasons: 
 
 misapplication of manual policy or law in the hearing decision,  
 typographical errors, mathematical erro r, or other obvious errors in the 

hearing decision that effect the substantial rights of the claimant: 
 the failure of the ALJ to address other relevant issues in the hearing decision. 






