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CONCLUSIONS OF LAW 
 

Department policies are cont ained in the Department of Human Service s, Bridges  
Administrative Manual (BAM) (2012), the Br idges Eligib ility Manual (BEM) (2011), an d 
the Reference Tables Manual (RFT) (2007).   
 

 The Family  Independence Program (FIP) was established purs uant to the Personal 
Responsibility and W ork Opportunity Reconc iliation Act of 1996, Public Law 104-193,  
42 USC 601, et seq .  The Department (formerly k nown as the Family Independence 
Agency) administers FIP pursuant to MCL 400.10, et seq ., and Mich Admin Code, R 
400.3101 t hrough R 400.3131.  FI P replaced the Aid to Dependent Children (ADC) 
program effective October 1, 1996.   
 

 The Food Assistanc e Program (FAP) [fo rmerly known as the Food Sta mp (FS) 
program] is establis hed by  the Food St amp Act of 1977, as amend ed, and is  
implemented by the federal r egulations contained in Title 7 of the Code of Federal 
Regulations (CFR).  The Department (formerly known as the Family Independenc e 
Agency) administers FAP pursuant to MCL 400.10, et seq ., and Mich Admin Code, R  
400.3001 through R 400.3015. 
 

 The Medical Ass istance (MA) program is es tablished by the Title XIX of the Soc ial 
Security Act and is im plemented by Title 42 of  the Code of Federal Regulations (CFR).   
The Department of Human Services (formerly known as the Family Independ ence 
Agency) administers the MA program pursuant to MCL 400.10, et seq ., and MC L 
400.105.   
 

 The Adult Medical Program (AMP) is established by 42 USC 1315, and is  
administered by the Department pursuant to MCL 400.10, et seq.   
 

 The State Disabilit y Assistance (SDA) progr am, which provides financial ass istance 
for disabled persons, is established by  2004 PA 344.  The D epartment of Human 
Services (formerly known as the Family  I ndependence Agency ) administers the SDA 
program pursuant to MCL 400.10, et seq ., and 2000 AACS, R 400.3 151 through R 
400.3180.   
 

 The Child Development and Care  (CDC) program is establis hed by Titles IVA, IVE 
and XX of  the Soc ial Security Act, the Ch ild Care and Developm ent Block Grant of 
1990, and the Personal Responsibility and Work Opportunity Reconciliation Act of 1996.  
The program is implemented by  Title 45 of  the Code of Fede ral Regulations, Parts 98 
and 99.  The Depart ment provides servic es to adults and children pursuant to MCL 
400.14(1) and Mich Admin Code, R 400.5001 through R 400.5015.  
 
Additionally, on August 20, 2012, the Department notified Claimant that she was entitled 
to MA coverage with a monthly deductible of  $1180 for April 1, 2012, ongoing.  To 
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receive MA under a Group 2 SSI-related MA ca tegory, the person must be aged (65 or  
older), blind, disabled, entitled t o Medica re or formerly blind or  disab led. BEM 105 
(October 1, 2010), p 1.  I ndividuals are eligible for Group 2 MA coverage when net 
income (countable inc ome minus allowable income deductions) does not exceed the 
applicable Group 2 MA prot ected income levels (PIL), wh ich is based on shelter area 
and fiscal group size.   BEM 105, p 1; BEM 166 (October 1, 2010), pp 1-2; BEM 544 
(August 1, 2008), p 1;  RFT 240 (July 1, 2007), p 1.   T he monthly PIL for an MA group 
of one (Claimant) living in Oakland County is $408 per month. RFT 200 (July 1, 2007), p 
1; RFT 240, p 1.  An individual whos e m onthly inc ome is in excess of the $408, the 
applicable PIL in this case, may become elig ible for MA assistance under the deductible 
program, with the deductible being equal to the amount that the group’s monthly income 
exceeds the PIL.  BEM 545 (July 1, 2011), p 1.   
 
In this case, the Department produced an  SSI-related MA budget showing how the 
deductible in Claimant's case was calculated.  Claimant verified that she received gross  
monthly Retirement, Survivors, and Disab ility Insurance (RSDI) benefits of $1608.  The 
Department properly subtract ed the $20 disregard t o est ablish Claimant' s total net 
income for MA purpos es at $1588. BEM 53 0 (August 1, 2008), p 1; BEM 541 (Januar y 
1, 2011), p 1.  Based on Claima nt's testimony at the hearing,  there were no additional 
deductions available to Claimant or other expenses s he incurred that qualified as need  
items under policy.  See BEM 541; BEM 544 (August 1, 2008).  Claimant’s net income  
of $1588 for MA purposes exc eeds the mont hly protected inc ome level of $408 by 
$1180.  Thus, the Department properly determined that Claimant is eligible for MA 
coverage once she incurs medical expens es in exc ess of $1180 during the month.  
Meeting a deductible means repo rting and verifying allowabl e medical expenses that  
equal or exceed the deductible amount for t he calendar month.  The MA group must 
report expenses by the last day of the thir d month following the m onth it wants medical 
coverage.  BEM 545, p 9; 42 CFR 435.831.  
 
At the hearing, Claimant indicated that she has unpaid old medica l bills.  If an MA client 
has allowable old bills in excess of the deductible amount, the Department applies these 
expenses towards the client's deductible for future months in accordance with BEM 545.   
Claimant was advis ed to submit any outst anding, unpaid m edical exp enses to the 
Department for processing in accordance with BEM 545.    
 

 
DECISION AND ORDER 

 
The Administrative Law Judge, based upon the above Findings of Fact and Conclusions 
of Law, and for the reasons stated on the record, finds that the Department  

 did act properly when it calculated Claimant's monthly MA deductible of $1180.  
 did not act properly when      . 
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