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4. The Department never activated MA coverage based on excess assets.  
 

5. On June 11, 2012, the Department rece ived the Claimant’s written request for 
hearing.   

 
CONCLUSIONS OF LAW 

 
Department policies are contai ned in the Bridges  Administrative Manual (“BAM”), the 
Bridges Eligibility Manual (“BEM”), and the Reference Tables (“RFT”).   
 

 The Family Independence Program (“FIP”) was established pursuant to the Personal 
Responsibility and W ork Opportunity Reconc iliation Act of 1996, Public Law 104-193,  
42 USC 601, et seq .  The Department, formerly k nown as the Family Independence 
Agency, administers FIP pursuant to MCL 400.10, et seq., and Mich Admin Code, Rules 
400.3101 through R 400.3131.  FI P replaced the Aid to Dependent Children (“ADC”) 
program effective October 1, 1996.   
 

 The Food Assistance Program (“FAP”), formerly known as the Food Stamp program, 
is established by the Food Stamp Act of 1977, as amend ed, and is implemented by the  
federal regulations contained in Title 7 of the Code of Federal Regulations (“CFR”).  The 
Department, formerly known as  the Fami ly Independence Agency, administers FAP 
pursuant to MCL 400.10, et se q., and Mi ch Admin Code, Rules 400.3001 through R 
400.3015. 
 

 The Medical Assistance (“MA”) program is es tablished by the Title XIX of the Social 
Security Act and is implemented by Title 42 of the Code of Federal Regulations (“CFR”).  
The Department of Human Services, form erly known as the Family Independenc e 
Agency, administers the MA pr ogram pursuant to MCL 400.10, et seq ., and MC L 
400.105.   
 

 The Adult Medical Program (“AMP”) is  established by 42 USC 131 5, and is  
administered by the Department of Human Services pursuant to MCL 400.10, et seq.   
 

 The State Disability Assistance (“SDA”) program, which provides financial assistance 
for disabled persons, is established by  2004 PA 344.  The D epartment of Human 
Services, formerly known as the Family Independence Agency , administers the SDA 
program pursuant to MCL 400.10, et seq ., and Mich Admin Code, Rules 400.3151 
through R 400.3180.   
 

 The Child Development and Care (“CDC”) program  is established by Titles IVA, IVE 
and XX of  the Soc ial Security Act, the Ch ild Care and Developm ent Block Grant of 
1990, and the Personal Responsibility and Work Opportunity Reconciliation Act of 1996.  
The program is implemented by  Title 45 of  the Code of Fede ral Regulations, Parts 98 
and 99.  The Depart ment provides servic es to adults and children pursuant to MCL 
400.14(1) and Mich Admin Code, Rules 400.5001 through R 400.5015.  
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The goal of the Medicaid program  is to ensure that essentia l health care s ervices are  
made available to those who otherwise could not afford them.  BEM 105 (2010), p. 1.  
Medicaid is also known as Medi cal Assistance.  BEM 105, p. 1.   The Medicaid program 
is comprised of several categories;  one ca tegory is for FIP reci pients while another is 
for SSI recipients.  BEM 105, p. 1.  The Medicare Savings Programs are SSI-related MA 
Categories.  BEM 165 (2010), p. 1.  
 
The three Medicare Savings Programs are Qualified Medicare Benefic iaries (also  
known as  full-coverage QMB); Specified Low -Income Medicare Beneficiaries (als o 
referred to as limited coverage QMB); and Additional Low-Income Medicare 
Beneficiaries (also known as ALMB or Q1).  BEM 165, p. 1.   
 
In addition to income, assets are also co nsidered when determining MA eligib ility.  The 
application asset limit for MA benefits is $2,000.00 for an individual, and $3,000.00 for a 
group of two.  BEM 400 (2012), p. 5.  
 
In this case, the Claimant’s countable assets, as discussed on the record, for the month 
of April exceeded the applicable  asset limit  of $3,000.00.  Although the Claimant wa s 
not eligible due to excess assets, the Depart ment mi stakenly s ent a Notice of Cas e 
Action to the Claimant informi ng her that she was approved for MA benefits for April 
2012 and denied for benefits in May 2012. Despite the notice , the Department did not  
activate coverage bas ed on the f act that the Claimant was not eligible for benefits due 
to excess assets. During the hearing, the Cl aimant became upset over the Department 
error contained in the Notice of Case Action;  however, as explained during the hearing, 
the mistake contained in the No tice of Case Action does not negate the fact that for the 
month of April 2012,  the Claimant was not eligible for MA benefits because her 
countable assets exc eeded $3,000.00.  This fact, which wa s not  disputed, can not be 
ignored.  The Department’s error contained in  the Notice of Case Action is harmless in 
that ultimately, the c orrect action was tak en. As the hearing was concluding and it  
became apparent that the Depar tment’s actions were proper, the Claimant left the 
hearing room.   
 
In light of the foregoing, the Department’s determination that the Claimant was not 
eligible for MA benefits for the month of April 2012 due to excess assets is AFFIRMED.   
 

DECISION AND ORDER 
 
The Administrative Law Judge, based on the above Findings of Fact and Conclusions of 
Law, and for the reasons stated on the record, finds the Department established it acted 
in accordance with department policy when it found the Cla imant ineligible for MA 
coverage due to excess assets for the month of April 2012.   
 
Accordingly, it is ORDERED: 
 
The Department’s determination is AFFIRMED.  
 






