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400.901-400.951.  An opportunity for a hearing shall be granted to an applicant who 
requests a hearing because his or her claim for assistance has been denied.  MAC R 
400.903(1).  Clients have the right to contest a department decision affecting eligibility 
or benefit levels whenever it is believed that the decision is incorrect.  The department 
will provide an administrative hearing to review the decision and determine the 
appropriateness of that decision.  BAM 600. 
 
The Medical Assistance (MA) program is established by Title XIX of the Social Security 
Act and is implemented by Title 42 of the Code of Federal Regulations (CFR).  The 
Department of Human Services (DHS or department) administers the MA program 
pursuant to MCL 400.10, et seq., and MCL 400.105.  Department policies are found in 
the Program Administrative Manual (BAM), the Program Eligibility Manual (BEM) and 
the Program Reference Manual (PRM).   
 
The department conceded on the record that it made an error in determining the 
divestment period.   
 

DECISION AND ORDER 
 
The Administrative Law Judge, based upon the above findings of fact and conclusions 
of law, decides that the department has conceded on the record that it made an error in 
determining the divestment period for claimant.   
 
Accordingly, the department's decision is REVERSED.  The department is ORDERED 
to reinstate claimant's review application. The Department is ORDERED to reassess 
claimant's eligibility for Medical Assistance and reassess claimant’s divestment period.  
Once the divestment period has been reassessed, the department shall to notify 
claimant in writing of the outcome.     
           
 

                                                             /s/_________________________ 
                   Landis Y. Lain 
                Administrative Law Judge 
                           for Maura D. Corrigan, Director 
                          Department of Human Services 
      
Date Signed:   
 
Date Mailed:  
 
NOTICE:  Administrative Hearings may order a rehearing or reconsideration on either 
its own motion or at the request of a party within 30 days of the mailing date of this 
Decision and Order.  Administrative Hearings will not order a rehearing or 
reconsideration on the Department's motion where the final decision cannot be 
implemented within 90 days of the filing of the original request.   
 






