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the Bridges Administrative Manual (BAM), the Bridges Eligibility Manual (BEM) and the 
Reference Tables Manual (RFT).    
 
Pursuant to Federal Rule 42 CFR 435.540, the Department of Human Services uses the 
federal Supplemental Security Income (SSI) policy in determi ning eligibility for disability 
under the Medical Assistance program.  Under SSI, disability is defined as: 
 

...the inability to do any substant ial gainful activity by reason 
of any medically determinable ph ysical or mental impairment 
which can be expected to result in death or which has lasted 
or can be expected to last for a continuous period of not less 
than 12 months.  20 CFR 416.905 
 

A set order is used to  determine disab ility, that being a five-step sequential evaluation 
process for determining whether an indivi dual is dis abled. (20 CFR 404.1520(a) and 
416.920(a)).  The steps are fo llowed in order.  Current wo rk activity, severity of 
impairments, residual functional capacity,  past wor k, age, or education and work  
experience is reviewed.  If it is determined that the Claimant is or  is not disabled at a 
step of the evaluation process, the evaluation will not go on to the next step. 
 
At step one, the Administrative Law Judge must determine whet her the Claimant is 
engaging in substantial gainful activity . (20 CFR 404.1520(b) and 416.920(b)).   
Substantial gainful activity (SGA) is defined as  work activity that is both substantial and 
gainful.  “Substantial work activity” is work  activity that involves doing signific ant 
physical or mental activities. (20 CFR 404.1572(a) and 416.972(a)).   “Gainful work 
activity” is work that is usually done for pay or  profit, whether or not a profit is realized. 
(20 CFR 404.1572(b) and 416. 972(b)).  Generally, if  an i ndividual has earnings from 
employment or self-employment  above a specific level set out  in the regulations, it is 
presumed that he/she has de monstrated the abilit y to engage in SG A. (20 CFR 
404.1574, 404.1575, 416.974, and 416.975).  If an individual engages in SGA, he/she is 
not disabled regardles s of how severe his/ her physical or mental  impairments are and 
regardless of his/her age, edu cation, and work experience.   If the individual is not 
engaging in SGA, the analysis proceeds to the second step. 
 
At step two, the Admi nistrative Law Judge must determine whether the claimant has a 
medically determinable impairment that is “severe” or a combination of impairments that 
is “severe” and that said impairment(s) have met the duration r equirement (20 CFR 
404.1520(c) and 416.920(a)(2)(ii) and (c)).  An impairment or combination of  
impairments is “sever e” within the meaning of the r egulations if it signific antly limits an 
individual’s ability to perform basic work acti vities.  An impairment or combinatio n of  
impairments is “not severe” when medical and other evidenc e establish only a slight  
abnormality or a combination of  slight abno rmalities that would have no m ore than a 
minimal effect on an individual’s ability to  work (20 CFR 404.1521 and 416. 921; Social 
Security Rulings (SSRs) 85-28, 96-3p, and 96-4p).  In order for an impair ment(s) to 
meet the duration requiremen t, the impairment(s) must hav e lasted or be expected to 
last for at least 12 months, unless the impairment(s) is ex pected to result in deat h 
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(20 CFR 416.909).  If the cl aimant does not have a severe medically determinable 
impairment or combination of impairments that hav e met the duration requirement , 
he/she is not disabled.  If the claimant ha s a severe impairment or combinatio n of  
impairments that have met the duration requir ement, the analysis  proceeds t o the third 
step. 
 
Statements about pain or  other symptoms do not alone establish disability.  There must 
be medical signs and laboratory findings  wh ich demonstrate a medical impairment.  
20 CFR 416.929(a). 
 

Medical reports should include –  
 
(1) Medical history. 

 
(2) Clinical findings (suc h as the re sults of physical or  mental status 

examinations); 
 

(3) Laboratory findings (such as blood pressure, X-rays); 
 

(4) Diagnosis (statement of disease or injury based on its signs and 
symptoms).  20 CFR 416.913(b). 

 
In determining dis ability under the law, the abili ty to work is measured.  An indiv idual's 
functional capacity for doing bas ic work activiti es is ev aluated.  If an individual has  the 
ability to perform basic work activities with out signific ant limitations, he or she is not 
considered disabled.  20 CFR 416.994(b)(1)(iv). 
 
Basic work activities  are the abilities and  aptitudes necessary to do most jobs.  
Examples of these include –  
 

(1) Physical functions such as wa lking, standing, sitting, lifting,  
pushing, pulling, reaching, carrying, or handling; 

 
(2) Capacities for seeing, hearing, and speaking; 
 
(3) Understanding, carrying out, and remembering simple 

instructions; 
 
(4) Use of judgment; 
 
(5) Responding appropriately to supervision, co-workers and 

usual work situations; and  
 
(6) Dealing with changes in a routine work setting.  20 CFR 

416.921(b). 
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Medical findings must allow a determination of  (1) the nature and limit ing effects of your 
impairment(s) for any period in question; (2 ) the probable duration of the impairment ; 
and (3) the residual functional capacity to do work-related physical and mental activities.  
20 CFR 416.913(d).   
 
Medical evidence may contain medical opinions.  Medical op inions are statements from 
physicians and psychologists or other a cceptable medical sources that reflect 
judgments about the nature and severity of the impairment(s), including your symptoms, 
diagnosis and prognosis, what  an indiv idual can do des pite impairment(s), and the 
physical or mental restrictions.  20 CFR 416.927(a)(2).   
 
All of the evidenc e relevant to  the claim, including m edical opinions, is rev iewed an d 
findings are made.  20 CFR 416 .927(c).  A statement by a m edical source finding that  
an individual is "disabled" or "unable to work" does not mean that disability exists for the 
purposes of the program.  20 CFR 416.927(e).  In ca ses involv ing agoraphobia and 
other phobic disorders, panic disorders,  and posttraumatic stress disorders , 
documentation of the anxiety reaction is  essential. At least one detailed description of  
your typical reaction is r equired. The description s hould include the nature, frequency, 
and duration of any panic attack s or other reactions, the pr ecipitating and exacerbating 
factors, and the functional effects.  

If the description is  provided by a medi cal source, the reporting physician o r 
psychologist should indicate the extent to which the descripti on reflects his or her own 
observations and the source of any anc illary information. Statements of other persons 
who have observed y ou may be used for this description if professional observation is  
not available.  
At step three, the Administrative Law J udge must determine wh ether the Claimant’s 
impairment or combination of impairments meets or medically equals the c riteria of an 
impairment listed in 20 CFR Par t 404, S ubpart P, Appendix 1.  (20 CFR 4 04.1520(d), 
404.1525, 404.1526, 416.920(d) , 416.925, and 416.926).  If the Claimant’s impairment 
or combination of impairments meets or medi cally equals the criter ia of a listing and 
meets the duration requirement , (20 CF R 404.1509 and 416.909), the Claimant is  
disabled.  If it does not, the analysis proceeds to the next step.   
 
Before considering st ep four of the sequential evaluation pr ocess, the Administrative 
Law Judge must first determine the Claim ant’s residual functional capac ity.  
(20 CFR 404.1520(e) and 416.920(e)).  An indiv idual’s resi dual functional capacity is  
his/her ability to do physical and mental work activities on a sustained basis despite  
limitations from his/ her impairments.  In making this  finding, all of the Claimant’s  
impairments, including impai rments that are not severe, must be considered.  
(20 CFR 404.1520(e), 404.1545, 416.920(e), and 416.945; SSR 96-8p).   
 
Next, the Administrative Law  Judge must determine at step four whether the Claimant  
has the residual functional capac ity to perform the requirements of his/her past relevant 
work. (20 CFR 404.1520(f) and 416.920(f)).  The term past relev ant work means work  
performed (either as the Claimant actually perfo rmed it or as it is generally performed in 
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the national economy) within the last 15 years or 15 years prior to the date that disability 
must be established.  In addition, the wo rk must have lasted long enough for the 
Claimant to learn to do t he job and have been SG A.  (20 CFR 404. 1560(b), 404.1565, 
416.960(b), and 416.965).  If t he Claimant has the residual functional capacity to do 
his/her past relevant work, the Claimant is not disabled.  If the Claimant is unable to do 
any past relevant work or does  not have any  past relevant work, the analysis proceeds 
to the fifth and last step.   
 
At the las t step of the sequential ev aluation proc ess (20 CFR 404.1520(g) and 
416.920(g)), the Administrative Law Judge must determine whether the Claimant is able 
to do any other work  consider ing his/her r esidual functional  capacity, age, education,  
and work experience.  If the Claimant is able to do other work, he/she is not disabled.  If 
the Claimant is not able to do other work and meets the duration requirements, he/she 
is disabled.   
 
The Administrative Law Judge is  responsib le for making the determination or decis ion 
about whether the statutory definition of disability is met.  The Administrative Law Judge 
reviews all medical findings and other ev idence that support a medical source's 
statement of disability.  20 CFR 416.927(e).   
 
At Step 1, I find the Claimant  is not engaged in substantial gainful activ ity as the 
Claimant has not wor ked sinc e 2011.  Therefore, Claimant is not disqualified from  
receiving disability at Step 1.   
 
At Step 2, I find the objective medical ev idence of re cord does support the Claimant’s 
contention that she is suffering from a se vere impairment.  The objective medica l 
evidence of record shows Clai mant’s impairments do meet the de m inimus lev el of 
severity and duration required for further analysis. 
 
At Step 3, I  find the Claimant’s m edical record will not support a fi nding that Claimant’s 
impairment(s) is a “list ed impairment” or equal to a listed impairment.  The most recent 
medical exam indicat es the Claimant walked with a normal gait and did not require the 
use of a walker, cane or crutches to ambul ate.  Accordingly, the Claimant cannot be 
found to be disabled based upon medical evidence alone.  20 CFR 416.920(d).      
 
At Step 4, I find the objective medical evidence of record is sufficient to es tablish that  
Claimant is not prevented from  performing the duties required from her past relevant  
employment for 12 months or more.  Accordingly, Claimant is disqualified from receiving 
disability at Step 4.   
 
Although I have found the Claimant disqualified from receiving disability at Step 3 and 4, 
I will continue to proceed through the sequent ial e valuation process to determine  
whether or not Claimant has the residual functional capacity to perform other jobs. 
 
To determine the physical demands (exertional  requir ements) of work in the national 
economy, we class ify jobs as sedentary, light, medium and heavy .  These terms have 
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the same meaning as they have in the Dictionary of Occupational Titles , published by 
the Department of Labor.  20 CFR 416.967.   
 
Sedentary work.  Sedentary wor k involves lifting no more t han 10 pounds at a time and 
occasionally lifting or  carrying articles lik e docket files, ledgers, and small tools.   
Although a sedentary job is defined as one which involves sitting, a certain amount of  
walking and standing is often necessary in carrying out job duties.  Jobs are sedentary if 
walking and standing are requir ed occasionally and other s edentary criteri a are met.  
20 CFR 416.967(a).   
 
Light work.  Light wor k involves lifting no more than 20 pounds at a time with frequent  
lifting or carrying of objects weighing up to 10 pounds.  Even though the weight lifted 
may be very little, a job is in this categor y when it requires a good deal of walking or  
standing, or when it involves sitting most of  the time with some pushing and pulling of 
arm or leg controls.  20 CFR 416.967(b).   
 
Medium work.  Medium work involves lifting no more than 50 pounds at a time with 
frequent lifting or carrying of objects weig hing up to 25 pounds.  If someone can do 
medium work, we determine that he or she can also do sedentary and light work.  20 
CFR 416.967(c).   
 
Heavy wor k. Heavy work involves lifting no more than 100 pounds at a time with 
frequent lifting or carrying of objects weig hing up to 50 pounds.  If someone can do 
heavy wor k, we determine that he or she c an also do medium, light, and sedentary 
work.  20 CFR 416.967(d).   
 
At Step 5, I find the Claimant has  failed to present the required competent, material and 
substantial evidence which would support a fi nding that Cla imant has an impairment or 
combination of impairments whic h would significantly  limit the physical or mental abilit y 
to do bas ic work activ ities.  20 CFR 416.92 0(c).  Although Claimant has c ited medical 
problems, the clinical documentat ion submitted by Claimant is  not sufficient to establish 
a finding that Claimant is disabled.  Base d on the medical ev idence of record, the 
Claimant is capable of performing a wide r ange of lig ht work and in addition, all the 
potentially applicable medical- vocational gui delines would direct a finding of n ot 
disabled given the Claimant’s  age, education and residual functional capacity.  In 
addition, the Claimant has described daily activi ties which are not  limited to the extent  
one would expect, given the complaints of di sabling symptoms and limitations.  There is 
no objective medical evidenc e to substantia te Claimant’s claim that the alleged 
impairment(s) are severe enough to reach t he criteria and definit ion of disabled.   
Accordingly, Claimant is not disabled fo r the purposes of the Medical Assistanc e 
disability (MA-P) program.   
 
The Department has establishe d by the nec essary competent, material and substantial 
evidence on the recor d that it was acting in compliance with depar tment policy when it 
determined that Claimant was not eligible to receive Medical Assistance. 

 






