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father’s name or any other useful information to assist the Office of Child Support 
in locating the father of her child.   

4. The Claimant testified that she only met the father of her child for one night at a 
party in .  

 
5. The information provided by the Claimant did not assist the Office of Child 

Support to locate the alleged father. 
 

6. The Claimant requested a hearing on 4/22/12 protesting the reduction of her FAP 
benefits the closure of her FIP cash assistance case  due to non cooperation with 
child support.  

  
CONCLUSIONS OF LAW 

 
 The Food Assistance Program (FAP) [formerly known as the Food Stamp (FS) 

program] is established by the Food Stamp Act of 1977, as amended, and is 
implemented by the federal regulations contained in Title 7 of the Code of Federal 
Regulations (CFR).  The Department (formerly known as the Family Independence 
Agency) administers FAP pursuant to MCL 400.10, et seq., and 1999 AC, Rule 
400.3001 through Rule 400.3015. 
 

The Medical Assistance (MA) program is established by the Title XIX of the Social 
Security Act and is implemented by Title 42 of the Code of Federal Regulations (CFR).  
The Department of Human Services (formerly known as the Family Independence 
Agency) administers the MA program pursuant to MCL 400.10, et seq., and MCL 
400.105.  Department policies are found in the Bridges Administrative Manual (BAM), 
the Bridges Eligibility Manual (BEM) and the Program Reference Manual (PRM). 
 

 The Family  Independence Program (FIP) was established pursuant to the Personal 
Responsibility and Work Opportunity Reconciliation Act of 1996, Public Law 104-193, 
42 USC 601, et seq.  The Department (formerly known as the Family Independence 
Agency) administers FIP pursuant to MCL 400.10, et seq., and 1999 AC, Rule 400.3101 
through Rule 400.3131.  FIP replaced the Aid to Dependent Children (ADC) program 
effective October 1, 1996.   
 
In the record presented, the Claimant has responded to a Final Notice of Non 
Cooperation and discussed the matter with the Office of Child Support (OCS). The 
Claimant provided no useful information to assist the OCS in locating the father of her 
child.  The Claimant advised the OCS only with the height and eye color of the alleged 
father.  No full name, birth date or address was provided.  The Claimant further testified 
that she had sex one time with the father and became pregnant 12 weeks later.  The 
Claimant at no time sought to locate the father, even though her sister (who lives in 

) saw him after the party that the Claimant and her sister attended on the night 
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her child was allegedly conceived.  As stated at the hearing by the Child Support Office 
representative, the OCS does not expect the Claimant to locate the alleged father, but is 
required to provide the most basic of information (name, birth date, social security 
number and address).   
 
The Claimant’s cooperation has been less than useful.  Although the Claimant testified 
she didn’t know she was pregnant for 12 weeks, she no doubt missed her cycle during 
the period and would have been alerted to the fact that she might have been pregnant.  
The Claimant’s testimony was less than credible, and her lack of efforts overall to assist 
the Department and to find out more about the alleged father of her child doe not exhibit 
cooperation.   
 
Based upon the record as a whole, it appears that the Claimant has not attempted to 
locate the absent father, nor has been forthcoming with any information.  The 
information she provided could apply to thousands of individuals and does not give 
sufficient information to locate the father.   
 
Based upon the information that has been provided by the Claimant, and the testimony 
of the parties, it is determined that the Claimant has not cooperated. Thus, the 
Department properly closed the FIP case and removed the Claimant from her FAP 
group.  Accordingly, it is determined that the Department did meet its burden of proof 
and properly reduced the Claimant’s Food Assistance and closed the Claimant’s FIP 
Cash Assistance due to non cooperation.  BEM 255.   
 

DECISION AND ORDER 
 
The Administrative Law Judge, based on the above findings of fact and conclusions of 
law, it is found that the Department properly closed the Claimant’s FIP cash assistance 
case and properly removed the Claimant from her FAP group for non cooperation with 
child support..  The Department’s actions are AFFIRMED. 
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