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5. On December 28, 2011, the Department received the Claimant’s timely written 
request for hearing.   

 
6. The Claimant’s CDC case closed effective January 1, 2012.  (Exhibit 3) 
 

CONCLUSIONS OF LAW 
 

Department policies are contai ned in the Bridges  Administrative Manual (“BAM”), the 
Bridges Eligibility Manual (“BEM”), and the Bridges Reference Tables (“RFT”).   
 
The Child Development and Car e program is established by T itles IVA, IVE and XX of 
the Social Security Act, the Child Care and Development Block Grant of 1990, and the 
Personal Responsibility and Work Opportunity Reconciliation Act of 1996.  The program 
is implemented by T itle 45 of  the Code of F ederal Regulations, Parts 98 and 99.  T he 
Department provides services to adults  and children pursuant to MCL 400.14(1) and 
Mich Admin Code, Rules 400.5001 through R 400.5015.  
 
The goa l o f CDC pro gram is to preserve the family unit and to promote its economic 
independence and s elf-sufficiency by promoting safe, affor dable, accessible, qualit y 
child care f or qualified families.  BEM 703.  The Depa rtment may provide  payment for 
child care services for qualifying  familie s when the parent(s)/substitute parent(s) is 
unavailable to provide the child care be cause of employment, education, and/or 
because of a health/s ocial condition for which treatment is being received and care is  
provided by an eligible provider.  BEM 703.  The client is responsible for obtaining any  
requested verifications needed t o determine eligibility.  BEM 702.   The client  is allowed 
a full 10 calendar day s from the date verifica tion is requested to provide the requested 
information.  BEM 702.   
 
All child care provider s must  be enrolled in Prov ider Management in order to receive 
payment from the Departmen t.  BEM 704.  Enrolled prov iders are assigned an ID 
number which differs from the provider’s tax ID or license num ber.  BEM 704.  The 
provider ID is necessary to authorize CDC payments.  BEM 704.   
 
In this case, the Department activated CD C benefits for 2011.  In or about July 2011,  
the Claimant’s child care provider moved to a new location and changed its name.  As a 
result, the provider was required to secure a new ID num ber that corresponded with the 
newly created entity.  The Depar tment was never notified of the change in entities and , 
as such, never issued a new ID number.  Ab sent the ID number, CDC benefits could no 
longer be authorized.   
 
In November 2011, the Department sent a redetermination packet to the Claimant  
requesting the verifications be submitted by  December 1, 2011.  The Claimant denied 
receipt of the packet and no verifications we re submitted.  The Department was unable 
to complete the redet ermination resulting in  a Notice of Case Action being generated, 
informing the Cla imant that the CDC be nefits were scheduled for closure effective 
January 1, 2012 bas ed on the failure to complete the review process.  D espite the 



2012-28042/CMM 

3 

Claimant’s timely hear ing request, which s hould have deleted the negative c ase action, 
the Claimant’s benefits closed effective J anuary 1, 2012.  That  being s tated, the 
Department cured thi s error by having the Claimant submit a new application.  The 
Department activate CDC benefits with no lack of coverage.  
 
During the hearing, the Claimant questioned why CDC benefit s were not paid to the 
provider from approximately July through December.  During this time, although th e 
Department had activated CDC benefits, payment was not authorized to the “new”  
provider because a new ID number was nee ded.  Although the Clai mant discussed the 
issue with the provider, she did not not ify the Department of  the change in 
circumstance.  The Claimant testified that she was unaware that the change needed to 
be reported because the “new” provider was t he s ame indiv idual just operating at  a 
different location under a new name.  The provider did not  seek a new ID number as 
required.  As such, the Department was not  aware of any CDC payments not paid.   
Ultimately, the Departm ent established it ac ted in accordance with Department policy  
when it activated CDC benefits for the Claimant.   
 

DECISION AND ORDER 
 

The Administrative Law Judge, based upon the above Findings of Fact and Conclusions 
of Law, and for the reasons stated on the re cord, finds that the Department acted in 
accordance with Department policy when it activated CDC coverage.   
 
Accordingly, it is ORDERED: 
 
The Department’s determination is AFFIRMED. 
 
 

 
__________________________ 

Colleen M. Mamelka 
Administrative Law Judge 

for Maura Corrigan, Director 
Department of Human Services 

Date Signed:  May 18, 2012 
 
Date Mailed:   May 18, 2012 
 
NOTICE:  Michigan Administrative Hearing Syst em (MAHS) may order a rehearing or  
reconsideration on either its own motion or at the request of a par ty within 30 days  of 
the mailing date of this Dec ision and Order .  MAHS will not or der a rehearing or  
reconsideration on the Department's mo tion where the final decis ion cannot be 
implemented within 90 days of the filing of the original request.  (60 days for FAP cases) 
 






