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5. On October 20, 2011, the Department closed Claimant’s case for failure to 
 submit redetermination in a timely manner. 
 
6. On October 20, 2011, the Department sent notice of the closure of Claimant’s 
 case. 
 
7. On October 27, 2011, Claimant filed a hearing request, protesting the closure.  

 
CONCLUSIONS OF LAW 

 
Department policies are found in the Bridges Administrative Manual (BAM), the Bridges 
Eligibility Manual (BEM) and the Reference Tables Manual (RFT).   
 
The Adult Medical Program (AMP) is available to individuals who meet all the eligibility 
factors in BEM 640. Certain aliens are limited to coverage of emergency services 
(ESO). BEM 640.  Income eligibility exists when the program group’s net income does 
not exceed the program group’s AMP income limit. BEM 640.  The AMP income limits 
are identified in RFT 236. When the client’s living arrangement changes during a month, 
the department uses the living arrangement with the higher income limit. BEM 640. Only 
countable income is used.  BEM 640. Countable income is income remaining after 
applying AMP policy in BEM 500, 501, 502, 503, 504.  BEM 640. 
 
Verification is usually required upon application or redetermination and for a reported 
change affecting eligibility or benefit level.  BAM 130. Verifications are considered timely 
if received by the date they are due. BAM 130. The department must allow a client 10 
calendar days (or other time limit specified in policy) to provide the requested 
verification.  BAM 130.  Should the client indicate a refusal to provide a verification or, 
conversely, if the time period given has elapsed and the client has not made a 
reasonable effort to provide it, the department may send the client a negative action 
notice.  BAM 130. 
 
Additionally, in accordance with Michigan law, it is presumed that a letter is received 
that is mailed in the due course of business. Good v Detroit Automobile Inter-Insurance 
Exchange, 67 Mich App 270 (1976). The proper mailing and addressing of a letter 
creates a presumption of receipt.  That presumption may be rebutted by evidence.  
Stacey v Sankovich, 19 Mich App 638 (1969); Good v Detroit Automobile Inter-
Insurance Exchange, 67 Mich App 270 (1976). The challenging party may rebut the 
presumption that the letter was received by presenting evidence to the contrary. See id. 
 
Here, Claimant states that he did not receive the Redetermination (DHS-1010) although 
it was properly addressed to him. There was no evidence in the record that the DHS-
1010 was returned as undeliverable. The Department has produced sufficient evidence 
of its business custom with respect to addressing and mailing of the Redetermination 
(DHS-1010) and the mere execution of the DHS-1010 in the usual course of business 
rebuttably presumes subsequent receipt by the addressee (Claimant).  Id.  Because the 
Department has produced sufficient evidence of its business custom with respect to the 





2012-14252/CAP 
 

 4

 




