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5. On 10/31/11, Claimant requested a hearing to dispute t he FAP benefit  
redetermination for 10/2011. 

  
CONCLUSIONS OF LAW 

 
The Food Assistanc e Program (formerly known as the Food Stamp Program) is  
established by the Food Stam p Act of 1977, as amended, and is implem ented by the 
federal regulations contained in  Title 7 of the Code of Feder al Regulations (CFR). DHS 
administers the FAP pursuant to  Michigan Compiled Laws 400.10, et seq. , and 
Michigan Administrative Code R 400.3001- 3015. DHS regulat ions are found in the 
Bridges Administrative Manual (BAM), th e Bridges Eligibilit y Manual (BEM) and the 
Reference Tables Manual (RF T). Updates to DHS regulations are f ound in the Bridge s 
Policy Bulletin (BPB). 
 
The controlling DHS r egulations are those that were in effe ct as of 10/2011, the month 
of the DHS decis ion which Cl aimant is dis puting. Current DHS manuals m ay be found 
online at the following URL: http://www.mfia.state.mi.us/olmweb/ex/html/. 
 
DHS uses  certain expenses to determine net income for FAP eligibility and benefit  
levels. BEM 554 at 1. For gr oups without a senior (over 60 years old), disabled or  
disabled veteran (SDV) member, DHS consider s the following expenses: child care and 
excess shelter (housing and utilities) up to a capped amount and c ourt ordered child 
support and arrearages paid to  non-household members. Fo r groups containing SDV 
members, DHS also considers the medical expenses for the SDV group member(s) and 
the full excess shelter expense. I t was not disputed that Claimant and his spouse were 
over 60 years of age and w ould be seniors for purposes of F AP benefit issuances . 
Accordingly, medical expenses  for Claimant and his s pouse are relevant factors to the  
FAP benefit decision. 
 
In the present case, Claimant disputed a DHS redetermination in wh ich ongoing FA P 
benefits were reduced. The FA P budget factors were discu ssed during the hearing and 
Claimant only disputed a failur e by DHS to factor medical ex penses into t he eligibility 
decision. 
 
DHS noted (in the Hearing Su mmary) that medical expens es such as $62/month for  
health insurance and $145.97 fo r medication were counted in the FAP det ermination. 
An attached budget (Exhibit 1) indicated ot herwise; it verified that no medical e xpense 
credit was  given to Claimant. Accordingl y, the F AP benefit  redetermination was 
incorrect for failing to factor medical expenses. 
 
It should be noted that DHS applies a $35 c opayment to monthly medical expenses  
(see BEM 556). Thus , any recalculation will reflect reported medical expenses of $35 
less than whatever amount is subsequently verified. 






