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5. On June 1, 2011, the Department sent notice of the  denial  closure to 
Claimant. 

 
6. On 7/6/11, Claimant filed a hearing request, protesting the  

 denial of the application.   closure of the  case.  
 

CONCLUSIONS OF LAW 
 

The Adult Medical Program (AMP) is established by 42 USC 1315, and is administered 
by the Department pursuant to MCL 400.10, et seq.  Department policies are contained 
in the Bridges Administrative Manual (BAM), the Bridges Eligibility Manual (BEM) and 
the Reference Tables Manual (RFT).   
 
Additionally, pursuant to a redetermination in May 2011, the Claimaint provided 
verification of income she receives from relatives who help support her.  As her 
verification of the income she recieves from her family, the Claimant submitted a form 
used to qualify her for  which indicated that her monthly income was 
$350.   The document indicates that it was certified on 5/1/11.  Exhibit 1. The Claimant 
has no earned income.   
 
The Department, based on the information provided by the Claimaint with her 
redetermination form, found that the Claimant's monthly income exceeded the Protected 
Income Level of $316.  RFT 236 and BEM 640.  Exhibit 2. 
 
The Claimant did not provide substantiation of her claim that the $350 was not the 
correct amount of her montly income.  The Claimant did not present other evidence of 
income she received through testimony by the  individuals providing the income to her, 
or written documentation from the individuals providing the income indicating the 
amount they paid to her monthly.  The Claimant's testimony did not overcome the  
document she provided to the Department to verify her income.  The Department was 
entitled to rely on the information that it had to close the Claimaint's AMP case.   BAM 
130.    
 
Based on the above Findings of Fact and Conclusions of Law, and for reasons stated 
on the record, the Administrative Law Judge concludes that the Department 
 

 properly denied Claimant’s application.   improperly denied Claimant’s application. 
 properly closed Claimant’s case.      improperly closed Claimant’s case. 

 
DECISION AND ORDER 

 
The Administrative Law Judge, based on the above Findings of Fact and Conclusions of 
Law, and for the reasons stated on the record, finds that the Department 

 did act properly.   did not act properly. 
 








