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5. On 7/25/11, Claimant requested a hearing to dispute the DHS usage of gift 
income in the 8/2011 FAP benefit determination. 

  
CONCLUSIONS OF LAW 

 
The Food Assistance Program (formerly known as the Food Stamp Program) is 
established by the Food Stamp Act of 1977, as amended, and is implemented by the 
federal regulations contained in Title 7 of the Code of Federal Regulations (CFR). DHS 
administers the FAP pursuant to Michigan Compiled Laws 400.10, et seq., and 
Michigan Administrative Code R 400.3001-3015. DHS regulations are found in the 
Bridges Administrative Manual (BAM), the Bridges Eligibility Manual (BEM) and the 
Reference Tables Manual (RFT). Updates to DHS regulations are found in the Bridges 
Policy Bulletin (BPB). 
 
The undersigned will refer to the DHS regulations in effect as of 7/2011, the month of 
the DHS decision which Claimant is disputing. Current DHS manuals may be found 
online at the following URL: http://www.mfia.state.mi.us/olmweb/ex/html/. 
 
A donation to an individual by family or friends is the individual's unearned income. BEM 
503 at 8. Bridges (the DHS database) counts the gross amount actually received, if the 
individual making the donation and the recipient are not members of any common 
eligibility determination group. Id. 
 
In the present case, it was not disputed that Claimant received $450/month in income 
from his brother. Claimant stated that the income was actually a loan and that DHS 
should not have budgeted the income. 
 
DHS regulations allow for the exclusion of “bona fide loan” income, however, the 
evidence showed that DHS had no reason to believe that the $450/month in income 
was part of a loan. Claimant conceded that he did not inform DHS that the money was a 
loan until the date of the administrative hearing. Claimant contended that DHS should 
have asked him if the income was part of a loan. However, there would be no logical 
reason for DHS to inquire. It is a client’s burden to report, not DHS’ burden to inquire. 
Accordingly, it is found that DHS properly counted the donation income as unearned 
income for Claimant. 
 
Claimant only disputed the budgeting of the donation income by DHS. Claimant did not 
wish to dispute any other part of the 8/2011 FAP benefit determination. As it has been 
found that DHS properly budgeted the donation income, it is found that DHS properly 
determined Claimant’s 8/2011 FAP benefit issuance.  
 






