


2011-34629/VLA 

 2

eligibility or benefit levels whenever it is believed that the decision is incorrect.  The 
department will provide an administrative hearing to review the decision and determine 
the appropriateness.  BAM 600.   
 
The Medical Assistance (MA) program is established by Title XIX of the Social Security 
Act and is implemented by Title 42 of the Code of Federal Regulations (CFR).  The 
Department of Human Services (DHS or department) administers the MA program 
pursuant to MCL 400.10, et seq., and MCL 400.105.  Department policies are found in 
the Bridges Administrative Manual (BAM), the Bridges Eligibility Manual (BEM) and the 
Reference Tables Manual (RFT).   
 
According to the departmental representative during the hearing, the caseworker relied 
on BAM 110 to withdraw Claimant’s MA application.  BAM 100 states that for Medicaid 
only, an authorization to represent is a form of a power of attorney.  When a person who 
gave the authorization dies, the power of attorney ends.  After death, the person does 
not exist as a legal entity, so no one can represent the person. However, if a person 
dies while the application is pending, the application should be processed. 
 
In this case, the MA application was filed after Claimant died.  However, Claimant did 
not give the authorization to file the application.  Claimant’s sister gave the authorization 
to file the MA application.  Because Claimant did not give the authorization, the right to 
file an MA application did not die with the Claimant.   
 
In addition, departmental policy states that as of January 1, 2011, for Medicaid only, an 
application may be made for a deceased person.  BAM 255.  Furthermore, policy states 
that any person, regardless of age, or their authorized representative (AR) may apply 
for assistance.  Application may be made on behalf of a client by his spouse, parent, 
legal guardian, adult child, stepchild, specified relative or any other person provided the 
person is at least age 18 or married. If this person is not a spouse, parent, legal 
guardian, adult child, stepchild, or specified relative the person must have a signed 
authorization to act on behalf of the client, by the client, client’s spouse, parent(s) or 
legal guardian.  BAM 255. 
 
An authorized representative must be: 
 

•  An adult child or stepchild. 
 
•  A specified relative, see BEM 135. 
 
•  Designated in writing by the client. 
 
•  Court appointed. 
 
•  A representative of an institution (such as jail or prison) where the client is in 
 custody. 
 

In this case, Claimant’s sister is a specified relative and according to policy may apply 
for Claimant’s MA benefits after he is deceased.  Moreover, the departmental 
representative was unable to point to any policy that instructed the department to 






