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5. After receiving the checklist and prior to 6/1/10, Claimant contacted DHS 
to report that the documents would be returned after 6/1/10 to allow 
Claimant’s physician time to complete the DHS-0049. 

 
6. On 6/1/10, Claimant returned several of the requested documents to DHS 

(see Exhibits 3-5). 
 
7. On an unspecified date, DHS denied Claimant’s redetermination of SDA 

and MA benefits after not receiving the DHS-0049 and DHS-1555 by 
6/1/10. 

 
8. On 6/18/10 Claimant submitted the DHS-0049 (Exhibit 6) and DHS-1555 

(Exhibit 7) 
 
9. On 7/29/10, Claimant requested a hearing disputing the termination of he 

ongoing SDA and MA benefits.  
  

CONCLUSIONS OF LAW 
 

The Medical Assistance (MA) program is established by Title XIX of the Social Security 
Act and is implemented by Title 42 of the Code of Federal Regulations (CFR). The 
Department of Human Services (formerly known as the Family Independence Agency) 
administers the MA program pursuant to MCL 400.10, et seq., and MCL 400.105.  
Department policies are found in the Bridges Administrative Manual (BAM), the Bridges 
Eligibility Manual (BEM) and the Reference Tables Manual (RFT). 
 
MA provides medical assistance to individuals and families who meet financial and 
nonfinancial eligibility factors. The goal of the MA program is to ensure that essential 
health care services are made available to those who otherwise would not have 
financial resources to purchase them. 
 
The State Disability Assistance (SDA) program which provides financial assistance for 
disabled persons is established by 2004 PA 344.  The Department of Human Services 
(formerly known as the Family Independence Agency) administers the SDA program 
pursuant to MCL 400.10, et seq., and MAC R 400.3151-400.3180.  Department policies 
are found in the Bridges Administrative Manual (BAM), the Bridges Eligibility Manual 
(BEM) and the Reference Tables Manual (RFT). 
 
DHS must periodically redetermine an individual’s eligibility for benefit programs. BAM 
210 at 1. A complete redetermination is required at least every 12 months. Id. 
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The redetermination process begins with DHS mailing a redetermination packet in the 
month prior to the end of the benefit period. Id at 4. The packet consists of forms and 
requests for verification that are necessary for DHS to process the redetermination.  
 
For MA benefits, clients are to be given 10 calendar days (or other time limit specified in 
policy) to provide the requested verification. BAM 130 at 5. If the client cannot provide 
the verification despite a reasonable effort, extend the time limit up to three times. Id. 
 
For SDA benefits, clients are allowed 10 calendar days (or other time limit specified in 
policy) to provide the requested verification. Id. DHS is to send a negative action notice 
when the client indicates refusal to provide a verification, or the time period given has 
elapsed and the client has not made a reasonable effort to provide it. Id. 
 
In the present case, several medical documents were requested from Claimant. 
Claimant timely returned some of the documents and reported to DHS that more time 
would be needed to submit two other documents. DHS did not dispute that Claimant 
requested more time to submit two of the requested documents. 
 
Concerning Claimant’s MA benefits, DHS should have extended the due date based on 
Claimant’s request. DHS regulations allow up to three extensions. The undersigned 
finds the DHS failure to extend the due date to be fatal to the termination of Claimant’s 
MA benefits. 
 
Concerning Claimant’s SDA benefits, DHS regulations indicate a negative action notice 
should be sent when there is a refusal to provide verification or the due date has passed 
and the client has not made a reasonable effort. Claimant never refused to submit the 
needed documents. It also cannot be reasonably argued that Claimant failed to make 
reasonable efforts to provide the DHS-0049 and DHS-1555. The DHS-0049 is a 
document that is to be completed by Claimant’s physician, not Claimant. It would be 
perfectly reasonable to expect the return of this document to take longer than 10 days. It 
is found that DHS improperly took a negative action concerning Claimant’s 
redetermination of SDA benefits. 
  

DECISION AND ORDER 
 
The Administrative Law Judge, based upon the above findings of fact and conclusions 
of law, finds that DHS improperly denied Claimant’s redetermination for MA and SDA 
benefits.  It is ordered that DHS reinstate Claimant’s SDA and MA benefits effective 
6/1/10, supplement Claimant for any SDA benefits not received and restore Claimant’s 
MA eligibility to the amount received prior to the termination. DHS shall redetermine 
Claimant’s future SDA and MA benefit eligibility based on previously submitted 
documents by Claimant.  
 






