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(5) Claimant submitted a completed shelter verification and employment 
verification prior to the due dates. 

 
(6) The Department denied Claimant’s F AP applic ation on Novem ber 15, 2010 

due to discrepancies and questionable verifications. 
 

(7) Claimant requested a hearing on Novem ber 15, 2010 contesting the denial of 
FAP benefits. 

 
CONCLUSIONS OF LAW 

 
The Food Assistance Program, formerly known as the Food Stamp (“FS”) program, is 
established by the Food Stam p Act of 1977, as amended, and is implem ented by the 
federal regulations contained in Title 7 of the Code of Federal Regulations (“CFR”).  The 
Department of Human Servic es (“DHS”), formally known as the Family Independ ence 
Agency, administers the FAP pr ogram pursuant to MCL 400.10,  et seq  and MAC R 
400.3001-3015.  Departmental policies are found in the Program Administrative Manual  
(“PAM”), th e Program Eligib ility Manual (“PEM”), and the Program Reference Manual 
(“PRM”). 

Clients must cooperate with the local offi ce in determining in itial and ongoing 
eligibility to provide verification.  PAM 130, p. 1.  The questionable information might be 
from the client or a third party.  Id.    The Department can us e documents, collateral 
contacts or home calls to verify information.  Id.   The client shou ld b e allo wed 10  
calendar days to provide the verification.  If  the client cannot provide the verification 
despite a r easonable effort, the time limit to  provide sh ould be ext ended at least once.  
PAM 130, p.4; PEM 702.  If th e client refuses to provid e the information or has not 
made a reasonable effort within the spec ified time period, then policy directs that a 
negative action be is sued.  PAM 130,  p. 4.   Before making an  eligibility determination, 
however, the Department must give the cli ent a reasonable opportuni ty to resolve any 
discrepancy between his statem ents and information from anot her source.  PAM 130,  
p.6.   

In the present case, Claimant credibly testified that she stopped working on September 
6, 2010 after injuring her neck. Claimant further  credibly testified that she provided  
accurate contact information from her empl oyer. The Department testified that they  
were unable to reach Claimant ’s former employer. The Depa rtment raised is sues with 
regard to Claimant shelter veri fication as well. Claimant credi bly testified that she pays 
no rent to her grandmother w hose home she was  residing in at the time of applic ation 
and presently. This Administrative Law Judge is satisfied with Claimant’s testimony and 
finds the requested documents were submitted prior to the deadline. This Administrative 
Law J udge cannot find that Claimant refused to cooperat e or failed to make a 
reasonable effort to cooperate. Therefore the denial of FA P application was imprope r 
and incorrect.  






