


201033627/AM 
 

2 

is implemented by Title 45 of the Code of Federal Regulations, Parts 98 and 99.  The 
Department of Human Services (formerly known as the Family Independence Agency) 
provides services to adults and children pursuant to MCL 400.14(1) and MAC R 
400.5001-5015.  Department policies are contained in the Bridges Administrative 
Manual (BAM), the Bridges Eligibility Manual (BEM) and the Program Reference 
Manual (PRM).  
 
In the present case, Claimant earns $1987 monthly in employment income. Claimant at 
hearing did not dispute the Department’s calculation of her income. The income limit for 
a 2 person household is $1607. RFT 270. Therefore, the Department was correct to 
deny Claimant’s application for excess income.  
 
Claimant argued at hearing that her expenses exceed her income and that her need for 
child day care assistance is substantial. The Department’s denial is based on excess 
gross income, and it is correct. 

DECISION AND ORDER 

The Administrative Law Judge, based upon the above findings of fact and conclusions 
of law decides that the Department properly denied Claimant’s day care application, and 
it is ORDERED that the Department’s decision in this regard be and is hereby 
AFFIRMED.  

 
 
 /s/ __________________________________ 

Aaron McClintic 
Administrative Law Judge  

For Ismael Ahmed, Director 
Department of Human Services 

 
Date Signed: October 21, 2010  
 
Date Mailed: October 21, 2010 
 
NOTICE: Administrative Hearings may order a rehearing or reconsideration on either its 
own motion or at the request of a party within 30 days of the mailing date of this 
Decision and Order.  Administrative Hearings will not order a rehearing or 
reconsideration on the Department's motion where the final decision cannot be 
implemented within 90 days of the filing of the original request. 
 
The Claimant may appeal the Decision and Order to Circuit Court within 30 days of the 
mailing of the Decision and Order or, if a timely request for rehearing was made, within 
30 days of the receipt date of the rehearing decision. 






