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closure due to the failure to complete the redetermination process.  
(Exhibit 3) 

 
6. On November 30, 2009, the Department received the Claimant’s written 

Request for Hearing.  (Exhibit 4)  
 

CONCLUSIONS OF LAW 
 

The Family Independence Program (“FIP”) was established pursuant to the Personal 
Responsibility and Work Opportunity Reconciliation Act of 1996, Public Law 104-193, 8 
USC 601, et seq.  The Department of Human Services (formerly known as the Family 
Independence Agency) administers the FIP program pursuant to MCL 400.10, et seq., 
and MAC R400.3101-3131.  The FIP program replaced the Aid to Dependent Children 
program effective October 1, 1996.  Department policies are found in the Bridges 
Administrative Manual (“BAM”), the Bridges Eligibility Manual (“BEM”), and the Bridges 
Reference Manual (“BRM”). 
 
The Department periodically re-evaluates cases to ensure continued eligibility for 
benefits.  BAM 210  For FIP purposes, a complete redetermination is required at least 
every 12 months.  BAM 210  Bridges processes case closure which includes notice to 
the client when receipt of the redetermination packet (which includes required 
verifications) is not recorded as received by the last date for timely notice in the 
redetermination month.  BAM 210  
 
In this case, a redetermination packet was mailed to the Claimant which contained the 
Claimant’s appointment notice.  The Claimant did not appear for the appointment which 
resulted in Bridges generating a Notice of Missed Interview to the Claimant.  Neither the 
redetermination form nor the Notice of Missed Interview were returned to the 
Department as undeliverable.  During this time, the Claimant’s address remained the 
same and she denied having problems receiving mail.  During the hearing, the Claimant 
denied receipt of the form/notice but acknowledge receipt of the negative action notice 
dated November 19, 2009.  The Department received the Claimant’s request for hearing 
on November 30th, after the FIP benefits had closed.  Under these facts, the 
Department established it acted in accordance with Department policy when it sent the 
Claimant the redetermination form, Notice of Missed Interview, and Notice of Case 
Action and then subsequently terminated the Claimant’s FIP benefits effective 
December 2009.  Accordingly, the Department’s determination is AFFIRMED. 
 

DECISION AND ORDER 
 
The Administrative Law Judge, based upon the above findings of fact and conclusions 
of law finds the Department established it acted in accordance with Department policy 
when it terminated the Claimant’s FIP benefits.   






