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The State Emergency Relief (“SER”) program is established by 2004 PA 344.  The SER 
program is administered pursuant to MCL 400.10, et seq. and by final administrative 
rules filed with the Secretary of State on October 28, 1993.  MAC R 400.7001-400.7049.  
The Department of Human Services’ [formally known as the Family Independence 
Agency] policies are found in the State Emergency Relief Manual (“ERM”). 
 
State Emergency Relief (“SER”) prevents serious harm to individuals and families by 
assisting applicants with safe, decent, affordable housing and other essential needs 
when an emergency situation arises.  ERM 101, p. 1.  When the group's heating or 
electric service for their current residence is in threat of or is already off and service 
must be restored, payment may be authorized to the provider up to the fiscal year cap. 
Payment must resolve the emergency by restoring or continuing the service for at least 
30 days. ERM 301. 
 
In the present case, Claimant requested hearing on June 3, 2009 requesting assistance 
with an electric utility bill. Initially, Claimant was approved for the benefit, but when the 
Department discovered that the bill had been addressed in bankruptcy court the 
application was denied on that basis. Records from DTE presented by the Department 
at hearing had a notation regarding a bankruptcy action. No evidence was presented by 
the Department explaining what the notation means. 
 
Claimant asserted at hearing that her bankruptcy had been dismissed and that the bill 
remains outstanding. Claimant submitted a certificate of mailing showing that an “Order 
dismissing case upon trustee affidavit” was issued in Case No by the Chapter 
13 Trustee  on July 30, 2008. 
 
This Administrative Law Judge finds that the Department was incorrect to deny the 
application for SER on the basis of the bill being addressed in bankruptcy court because 
at the time of the denial by the Department the bankruptcy had been dismissed.  

 
DECISION AND ORDER 

 
This Administrative Law Judge decides that the Department was incorrect in the denial 
of SER benefits, and it is ORDERED that the Department’s decision in this regard be 
and is hereby REVERSED. Claimant’s application for SER benefits shall be reinstated 
and reprocessed. 
 
 
 

______________________________ 
Aaron McClintic 

Administrative Law Judge  
For Ismael Ahmed, Director 
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